OFFICE OF THE COUNTY EXECUTIVE
ROCKVILLE, MARYLAND 20850

Isiah Leggett
County Executive MEMORANDUM
September 28, 2016
TO: Nancy Floreen, President, Montgomery County Council
FROM: Isiah Leggett, County Executive 4;«4%:17 L. Fired finre ( /4477;/7>

SUBJECT: Executive Regulation 21-15 Adoption of the 2012 International Green
Construction Code, with amendments which supersedes Executive Regulation
19-07AM — Method 2 and Proposed Bill to amend Chapter 8, Article VII

I am pleased to submit Executive Regulation 21-15 (ER 21-15) which adopts the
2012 International Green Construction Code, as amended (IGCC) for the County Council’s
consideration under Method 2 per Section 8-13 of the Montgomery County Code. The IGCC is
a building code that sets a baseline requirement for energy efficiency and resource conservation
to be met by new commercial construction. ER 21-15 will apply to new commercial
construction and additions that exceed 5000 square feet.

I will also be sending proposed legislation that would repeal Montgomery County
Code, Chapter 8, Article VII (the “Green Buildings Law”). With adoption of the IGCC, the
Green Buildings Law is no longer necessary as the IGCC sets a higher performance baseline than
the Green Buildings Law and applies to a broader spectrum of construction. Therefore, I will be
requesting that you introduce the attached amendment to Montgomery County Code Chapter 8,
Article VII for passage by the County Council in connection with promulgation of the IGCC.

The proposed regulation followed several public work sessions and was then
advertised in the December 2015 issue of the Montgomery County Register and the comment
period was extended from December 31, 2015 to January 31, 2016. While the IGCC will set the
baseline energy and resource conservation level of performance for new construction, builders,
owners and developers may still choose to have their buildings certified at LEED Standards’.
All projects over 5000 square feet will be required to adhere to energy and resource conservation
requirements and depending on size will be required to provide for certain project electives that
provide additional resource conservation.

! Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design or “LEED?” is a rating based on a point system that was
developed by the United States Green Building Council for achieving different levels of resource conservation.

montgomerycountymd.gov/311 1 301-251-4850 TTY




Nancy Floreen, President
Page 2

Comments generally fell into several categories. Some commenters urged that the
County not adopt the IGCC because of a belief that the current Green Buildings Law requiring
LEED certification is adequate. I do not agree. The built environment is a major contributor to
greenhouse gas emissions in Montgomery County. We have made strides forward with our
Green Buildings Law and our prompt adoption of new cycles of energy codes, but we need to do
more. As of April the county had only 147 LEED certified buildings recorded despite the fact
that the Green Buildings Law has been in place since March 1, 2007. The IGCC will move us
forward by requiring building baseline performance and capturing more new construction by
" applying to new construction and additions over 5000 square feet.

A second area of comments was that there should be an option to use either the
IGCC or LEED. Adoption of the IGCC does not preclude obtaining LEED certification. The
IGCC is a baseline for how a building is constructed to meet performance requirements. Itisa
code requirement that will provide greater certainty of reducing our carbon footprint. LEED is a
point system that is based on a later, post-completion certification. The IGCC will capture more
construction with a focus on even greater conservation of energy and resources through reuse
and reduction of materials. Alternatives to the IGCC will be available where an applicant can
show an equivalent level of compliance.

Some commenters asked that there be a grandfathering of projects that are in
development. This has been addressed through a 180-day optional pathway period for projects
that are in process. The Code Modification process is also available for a situation where there
may be a compliance hardship.

Finally, some commenters felt that the proposed amendments weaken the IGCC
and do not go far enough because certain provisions have been moved to Appendix items. The
IGCC is an umbrella code and covers areas of land use planning, water conservation, material
conservation, energy conservation and emission reduction, indoor environmental air quality, etc.
Consistent with streamlining efforts, it is important to apply the IGCC in areas over which the ‘
Department of Permitting Services has control. The IGCC, without amendment, includes subject
matter areas committed to the authority of others. Accordingly, the areas of code that the .
Department of Permitting Services can control and effectively enforce are retained as base code
requirements and areas that may be under the authority of others such as water conservation and
site planning are moved to the Appendix and may be offered as project electives that an applicant
may offer, subject to review and approval of the authority having jurisdiction, and for which the
Department will require demonstrated compliance. We are sensitive to not create inconsistent -
requirements from those that are imposed by other authorities.

- While some commenters felt that the IGCC is a burden and others that it is not
enough, ER 21-15 strikes a balance. The threshold for applying the IGCC is for buildings over
5000 square feet as opposed to the 10,000 square feet threshold of the Green Buildings Law.
The number of additional sustainability electives that are required is staggered based on the size
of the construction. In addition to baseline code requirements, smaller projects are required to
provide two to three electives and projects over 20,000 square feet are required to provide a
minimum of four electives.



Nancy Floreen, President
Page 3

A summary of the comments received is attached for your information. If you
have any questions, please contact Hadi Mansouri, Chief Operating Officer or Diane Schwartz
Jones, Director, in the Department of Permitting Services.

Attachments



Mark U.p Copy



MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

Montgomery County Regulation on:

COMCOR 08.00.03 ADOPTION OF THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL GREEN
CONSTRUCTION CODE

DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

Issued by: County Executive
Regulation No. 21-15

Authority: Code Sections 8-13 and 8-14
Supersedes: Executive Regulation 19-07AM
Council Review: Method 2
Register Vol. 32 Issue 12
Comment deadline: January 31,2016
Effective date:

Sunset date: None

SUMMARY: This regulation adopts the 2012 International Green Construction Code (IGCC), with
amendments, and supersedes Executive Regulation 19-07AM.

ADDRESSES: Department of Permitting Services
255 Rockville Pike, Second Floor
Rockville, Maryland 20850

STAFF CONTACT: Hemal Mustafa, Manager
Division of Commercial Building Construction
240-777-6226
Hadi Mansouri, Chief Operating Officer
Department of Permitting Services
240-777-6233




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockyville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

BACKGROUND INFORMATION: The Department of Permitting Services enforces Chapter 8
(Buildings) of the Montgomery County Code. This regulation is adopted under Sections 8-13 and 8-14 of
the Montgomery County Code. It is a coordinated effort whereby Article VII of Chapter 8 of the
Montgomery County Code is to be repealed under separate Council action and the 2012 International
Green Construction Code is adopted, with amendments, as the energy conservation and sustainable
building design standard in Montgomery County, Maryland. This regulation supersedes Executive
Regulation No. 19-07AM.

COMCOR [08.26.01] 08.00.03 Buildings — Energy [Efficiency] Conservation and [Environmental]
Sustainable Building Design.

[08.26.01.01] 08.00.03.01 [I:] PURPOSE

[1.0] This regulation [implements the Montgomery County Green Buildings Law by specifying the:]
adopts the 2012 International Green Construction Code (IGCC), with amendments, and establishes:

(a) [LEED Rating System and any equivalent energy and environmental design
standard that applies to each type of covered building under Section 8-49 of the County
Code;]

[(b)] aprocess to verify that [a covered building complies] certain new construction and
additions comply with the applicable standard [, including types of persons who are
qualified to verify compliance];

[(©)] (b) standards and procedures under which the Director may approve waivers or
modifications of [Section 8-49 of the County Code] the IGCC, when compliance would be
impracticable or unduly burdensome and the public interest would be served by the waiver
or modification; and

[(d)] (c) standards and procedures for any enforcement mechanism that the
Department finds necessary to accomplish the purposes of the [Montgomery County Green
Buildings Law] energy conservation and sustainable building design standard adopted in

this regulation.




MONTVGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:
Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

[08.26.01.02] 08.00.03.02 [11:] APPLICABILITY

[2.0] This regulation applies to any newly constructed [or extensively modified], and to any addition to
an existing non-residential or multi-family residential building, including R-2 and R-4 residential
buildings (Group R-4 includes uses such as Assisted Living, Congregate Care, Group Homes and Social
Rehabilitation Facilities), that [has or] will have at least [10,000] 5,000 square feet of gross floor area.
This regulation does not apply to any building or structure exempt under Section 101.3 of the IGCC and
Section 08.00.03.07.01 of this regulation.

[08.26.01.03] 08.00.03.03 [IT:] DEFINITIONS

[3.0] For the purposes of this regulation, the following words and phrases have the meanings indicated.
Words and phrases defined and used in Chapter 8 of the County Code have the meanings indicated in that
Chapter.

Addition means an extension or increase in the gross floor area or height of an existing building or
structure. Addition also includes the addition of building components such as electrical and
mechanical systems or elements to an existing building or structure.

[Applicable rating system means:

(1)  For a building that uses the USGBC certification process, the LEED rating system
for which the building is registered at the USGBC;

2) For a building that uses the County certification process, the LEED rating system
that would apply to the building if it were registered with the USGBC on the date
that the building is registered with the Department; or

3) For a building that uses an equivalent rating certification process, the equivalent
rating system for which the building is registered.]

Commissioning Plan means the Commissioning Plan approved by the code official.

[County building means any covered building for which the County government finances at least
30% of the cost of:

(D construction, for a newly constructed building; or
(2) modification, for a building that is extensively modified.]




- MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

Effective Date:

[County certification process means the process administered by the Department to verify that a
covered building complies with the required standard.]

[Covered building means a newly constructed or extensively modified non-residential or multi-
family residential building that has or will have at least 10,000 square feet of gross floor area.]

Department means the Department of Permitting Services.
Director means the Director of the Department of Permitting Services.

[Equivalent rating certification process means the process administered by an equivalent rating
entity to verify that a covered building complies with the required standard.]

[Equivalent rating entity means a person or entity that the Director finds is qualified to certify that
a building complies with the required standard under an equivalent rating system.]

[Equivalent rating system means an energy efficiency and environmental design rating system that
the Director finds is equivalent to the applicable LEED rating system.]

[Extensively modified refers to any structural modification which alters more than 50% of the
building’s gross floor area, as indicated on the application for a building permit. Extensively
modified does not include any modification that is limited to one or more of the following building
systems: mechanical; electrical; plumbing; heating, ventilation, and air conditioning (HVAC); and
fire protection.]

[Green Building Concept Plan means a document that:

(a) contains proof that a building has been registered with the USGBC, the
Department, or an equivalent rating entity;

(b)  identifies the applicable rating system;

(c) describes the building’s scope; and

(d) using a checklist provided by the Department, describes anticipated energy
efficiency and environmental design features in the following areas: sustainable
site, water efficiency, energy and atmosphere, materials and resources, indoor
environmental quality, and innovation and design process.]

[Green Buildings Law means the Montgomery County Green Buildings Law codified in Chapter 8
(Buildings), Article VII (Energy Efficiency and Environmental Design) of the County Code.]

4



MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:
Originating Depariment: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

[LEED refers to the series of Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design (LEED) rating
systems developed by the USGBC (US Green Building Council).]

[LEED rating system means the particular LEED rating system that applies to a covered building. ]

Multi-family residential building means any multi-family residential or mixed-use residential
building that [is taller than 4 stories] has at least 5,000 square feet of gross floor area. Multi-family
residential building does not include a residential care or assisted living building which can house
no more than 16 occupants.

Newly constructed refers to a new stand-alone building or an addition to an existing building.

[(1)  Except as provided in paragraph (2), a] A newly constructed building includes any
addition to or enlargement of an existing building, but does not include any change to an
existing portion of a building, ]

[(2) For any building for which an application for all necessary building permits was filed
before September 1, 2008, any later addition to that building constitutes a newly constructed
building only if the addition would increase the building’s land coverage by at least 100%
and gross square floor area by at least 10,000 square feet. ]

Non-residential building means a building not used as a dwelling.
Non-residential building does not include any:

(1)  day care center for 5 or fewer persons;

(2) accessory building or structure;

3) agricultural building, stable, barn, or greenhouse;

(4)  parking garage that is not heated or cooled; or

%) other building characterized as a miscellaneous building in the edition of the ICC
International Building Code designated under Section 8-13 of the Montgomery

County Code.

[Project plan means a project plan approved by the Planning Board under Chapter 59 of the County
Code.]

[Preliminary plan means a preliminary plan of subdivision approved by the Planning Board under
Chapter 50 of the County Code.]




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

[Registered design professional means an architect, landscape architect, or engineer who is licensed
by the State of Maryland.]

[Required standard means the energy efficiency and environmental design standard that applies to
a covered building under Section 8-49 of the County Code.]

[Regulatory approval means an approved project plan, preliminary plan, site plan, or special
exception. | :

[Site plan means a site plan approved by the Planning Board under Chapter 59 of the County Code.]

[Special exception means a special exception approved by the Board of Appeals under Chapter 59
of the County Code./

[Temporary Use and Occupancy Certificate means a certificate issued by the Department at the
request of a building permit holder before the entire work covered by the building permit is
completed which authorizes use and occupancy of the building for a specified period.]

[USGBC means the US Green Building Council, an organization that has developed and published
the LEED rating system to measure the energy efficiency and environmental performance of a
building.]

[USGBC certification process means the certification process administered by the USGBC to verify
that a building complies with the required standard.]

[08.26.01.04] 08.00.03.04 [IV:] POLICY

[4.0  The Department of Permitting Services supports the General Services Administration (GSA)
commissioned evaluation of nationally recognized green building rating systems titled Sustainable
Building Rating Systems Summary dated July 2006. That report, researched by the Pacific Northwest
National Laboratory, identified the USGBC LEED rating system as the “most appropriate and credible”
rating system for green building design and construction standards. The Department hereby identifies the
LEED rating system as the benchmark for evaluating proposed equivalent rating systems on a project by
project basis.]

[4.1 The Department will accept building permit applications for covered buildings under three
optional methods of certification.]




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

[4.2  The first and preferred method to demonstrate compliance with the required standard is the
USGBC certification process. Projects formally registered, submitted for review, and certified by the
USGBC will be accepted as certified by the Department. The Department may review and inspect
certified credits approved by the USGBC as necessary to ensure compliance with the Green Buildings
Law.]

[4.3  The second method to demonstrate compliance with the required standard is the County
certification process. Projects not submitted to the USGBC for formal review will undergo a complete
review and inspection process via the Department, using the LEED rating system to document design,
construction, and post-construction phase compliance. Submission of credit documentation under the
Green Buildings Law for projects using the LEED rating system must be certified by a registered design
professional.]

[4.4  The third method to demonstrate compliance with the required standard is an equivalent rating
certification process. Consideration of projects using any equivalent rating system will be made via the
building code modificafion process administered by the Department under Section 8-15 of the County
Code. Submission of sufficient information regarding the proposed alternative rating system is required to
allow the Director to determine whether it is an equivalent rating system. Submission of credit
documentation under the Green Buildings Law for projects using an equivalent rating system must be
certified by a registered design professional.]

In May 2011, the State of Maryland authorized local jurisdictions to adopt the International Green
Construction Code as one of the Model Performance Codes. The Department of Permitting Services
supports and recommends adoption of the IGCC as establishing a high performance baseline for energy
conservation and sustainable building practices.

[08.26.01.05] 08.00.03.05 [V:] PROCEDURES

[5.0  Before a person applies to the Planning Board or Board of Appeals for the first regulatory
approval relating to a project that includes a covered building, the person must register the building with
the USGBC, the Department, or an equivalent rating entity. ]

[5.1  When a person applies to the Planning Board or Board of Appeals for the first regulatory approval
for a project that includes a covered building, the person must submit a Green Building Concept Plan to
the Department.]




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

[5.2 A Green Building Concept Plan submitted to the Department under Section 5.1 is a conceptual
document that is intended to be a planning tool for the Department, is not legally binding, and can be
modified any time before a building permit is issued.]

[5.3  To obtain the Department’s approval of design, construction, and post-construction phase credits
under the County certification process, a building owner must submit to the Department any information
relating to the building’s design, construction methods and materials, and operation that the Department
requires. ]

[5.44 When a person submits an application for a building permit for a covered building to the
Department, the person must also submit an application for green building certification which:

(@ Contains proof of registration with the USGBC, Department, or equivalent rating entity;

(b) Identifies the applicable rating system;

(©) Identifies the registered design professional who is the point of contact for project
information;

() Identifies all approved or anticipated design, construction, and post-construction phase
credits; and

(e) Includes any documentation of approved or anticipated design, construction, or post-
construction phase credits required by the Department.]

[5.5 Before construction begins on a covered building for which a building permit has been issued, the
applicant and the project’s registered design professional must attend a Green Building Construction
Meeting with the Department and demonstrate that a process is in place to adequately implement and
document construction phase credits. ]

[5.6  The Department may conduct inspections of any covered building at any time as necessary to
document construction and post-construction phase credits.]

[5.7 Before a Use and Occupancy Certificate for a covered building is issued to an applicant:

(a) The applicant and the project’s registered design professional must attend a Green
Building Credit Verification meeting with the Department and demonstrate that the
required number of design and construction phase credits have been obtained; and

(b) The Department must inspect the covered building and verify that the design and
construction phase credits have been obtained.]

[5.8 If a covered building does not comply with the required standard, the Department must not issue a
Use and Occupancy Certificate. The Department may issue a Temporary Use and Occupancy Certificate

8




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
- EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:
Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

if the applicant demonstrates that a process is in place to adequately implement and document anticipated
construction or post-construction phase credits and the building can be safely occupied. The Director may
revoke a Temporary Use and Occupancy Certificate if the building does not comply with the Green
Buildings Law or this regulation. ]

The IGCC is part of the International Code Council (ICC) building codes family and as such is
subject to the same regulations governing the approval and issuance of building permits, and the
inspection procedures and policies codified in the Chapter 8 of the Montgomery County Code.

[08.26.01.06] [VI: MODIFICATIONS]

[6.0 Requests for Modification to the requirements of the Green Buildings Law or this regulation will
be addressed via the Department’s Building Code Modification process administered under Section 8-15
of the County Code. In addition to modifications for proposed use of an equivalent rating system,
modifications may include requests for waivers when compliance is impracticable or unduly burdensome
and the public interest would be served by a waiver or modification. ]

[08.26.01.07] 08.00.03.06 AMENDMENTS TO THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL GREEN
CONSTRUCTION CODE (IGCC)

08.00.03.06.01 Section 101 — General

Subsection 101.1. Replace the brackets and the phrase inside the brackets with
“ Montgomery County Maryland ”.

Subsection 101.3. Replace Subsection 101.3 with the following: The provisions of this
code shall apply to new construction as it relates to design and construction of buildings
and additions, building sites, removal and demolition of every building or structure or any
appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures and to the site on
which the building is located. Occupancy classifications shall be determined in accordance
with the International Building Code (IBC).

Subsection 101.3. Add the following exception: 5. The code shall not apply to items 5.1,
5.2and 5.3

5.1. Those low energy buildings that are exempt from the energy requirements of
the current International Energy Conservation Code, including open parking
garages., greenhouses, warehouses, storage buildings.




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

5.2 Any new building with less than 5000 sq.ft. gross floor area.

5.3 Any addition to an existing building which will create less than 5000 sq.ft. of
additional gross floor area.

Subsection 101.4. Add a second sentence to read: “Appendix A shall apply as amended
by subsection A102.1.”

08.00.03.06.02 Section 102 — Applicability

Subsection 102.4. Delete the phrases “the International Code Council Performance Code
(ICCPQC)Y”, “the International Plumbing Code (IPC)”, and “the International Property
Maintenance Code (IPMC).” Replace the phrase “International Fire Code (IFC)” with
“Montgomery County Fire Code.”

Subsection 102.6. Delete the phrase “the International Property Maintenance Code,” and
replace the phrase “International Fire Code” with “Montgomery County Fire Code.”

08.00.03.06.03 Section 108 — Board of Appeals. Delete.

08.00.03.06.04 Section 202 — Definitions

Approved Agency. Add the phrase “by the code official or authority having jurisdiction”
after the phrase “such agency has been approved.”

Addition. Add a second sentence to read: “Addition also includes the addition of building
components such as electrical and mechanical systems or elements to an existing building
or structure.”

08.00.03.06.05 Section 301 — General

Subsection 301.2. Add the phrase, “including Appendix A” after word “applicable” in the
last sentence.

08.00.03.06.06 Section 302 — Jurisdictional Requirements

" Subsection 302.1. Delete items 1 and 2, and renumber the second Item 2 as Item 1.

10



MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012

Number: 21-15

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

Effective Date:

Subsection 302.1.1. Delete.

Table 302.1. Replace Table 302.1 with the following:

TABLE 302.1
REQUIREMENTS DETERMINED BY THE JURISDICTION
Section Section Title or Description and Directives Jurisdictional
Requirements
Chapter 1. SCOPE
101.3 Detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single- Yes X No
Exception 1.1 family dwellings (town-houses) not more than three stories in
height above grade plane with a separate means of egress, their
accessory structures, and the site or lot upon which these
buildings are located, shall comply with ICC 700.
101.3 Group R-3 residential buildings, their accessory structures, and [1 Yes X No
Exception 1.2 | the site or lot upon which these buildings are located, shall
comply with ICC 700
101.3 Group R-2 and R-4 residential buildings four stories or less in Yes [ I1No
Exception 1.3 | height above grade plane, their accessory structures, and the
site or lot upon which these buildings are located, shall comply
with ICC 700. ‘
Chapter 4. SITE DEVELOPMENT AND LAND USE
402.2.1 Flood hazard area preservation, general [1Yes Xl No
402.2.2 Flood hazard area preservation, specific [1Yes X No
402.3 Surface water protection [1Yes X No
402.5 Conservation area [ Yes Xl No
402.7 Agricultural land [1Yes X No
402.8 Greenfield sites [ 1Yes X No
407.4.1 High-occupancy vehicle parking L] Yes X No
407.4.2 Low-emission, hybrid and electric vehicle parking L] Yes Xl No
409.1 Light pollution control 1 Yes X No
Chapter S. MATERIAL RESOURCE CONSERVATION
AND EFFICIENCY
503.1 Minimum percentage of waste material diverted from landfills X 50%
Chapter 6. ENERGY CONSERVATION, EFFICIENCY
AND CO:e EMISSION REDUCTION

11




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: international Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

302.1, 602.1 zEP] of Jurisdictional Choice- The jurisdiction shall indicate a | Occupancy:
zEPI of 50 or less in each occupancy for which it intends to ALL
require enhanced energy performance. zEPI:; 50
604.1 Automated demand response infrastructure [1Yes
Chapter 7. WATER RESOURCE CONSERVATION,
QUALITY AND EFFICIENCY
702.7 Municipal reclaimed water L1 Yes
Chapter 8. INDOOR ENVERONMENTAL QUALITY
, AND COMFORT
804.2 Post- Construction Pre-Occupancy Baseline IAQ Testing Yes
807.1 Sounds transmission and sound levels Yes
Chapter 10. EXISTING BUILDINGS: DELETE IN ITS
ENTIRETY
1007.2 Evaluation of existing buildings L[] Yes
1007.3 Post Certificate of Occupancy zEPI, energy demand, and CQ?e e
emissions reporting

Appendix A2
Al01 Minimum 2 project electives shall be selected for a building Ye
with gross floor area less than 10,000 sq.ft.
Al101 Minimum 3 projects electives shall be selected for building Ye
with gross floor area between 10,000 and 20,000 sq.ft.

AlQl Minimum 4 projects electives shall be selected for building Yes N
with gross floor area greater than 20,000 sq.ft.

N | §

N

2 If a Chapter or Section moved to Appendix A is administered under authority granted to another
governmental entity or agency, such as the Maryland Department of Environment, Maryland-National
Capital Park & Planning Commission, or Washington Suburban Sanitary Commission, then the applicant
must exceed the minimum requirements of code, standards, and regulations as written and enforced by the
governmental entity or agencies, and any such Chapter or Section will not count as a minimum project

elective.

08.00.03.06.07 Section 303 — Whole Building Life Cycle Assessment

Section 303. Move Section 303 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.08 Section 401 — General

Subsection 401.2. Move Subsection 401.2 to Appendix A.

12



MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Sireet. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Depariment: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

08.00.03.06.09 Section 402 — Preservation of Natural Resources

Section 402. Move Section 402 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.10 Section 403 — Storm Water Management

Section 403. Move Section 403 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.11 Section 404 — Landscape Irrigatiqn and Outdoor Fountains

Section 404. Move Section 404 to Appendix A.

Appendix A, subsection 404.1.1. Delete the phrase “municipal reclaimed water or with.”

08.00.03.06.12 Section 405 — Management of Vegetation, Soils and Erosion Control

Section 405. Move Section 405 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.13 Section 407 — Transportation Impact

Section 407. Move Section 407 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.14 Section 408 — Heat Island Mitigation

Subsection 408.2. Replace the phrase “50 percent” with “40 percent.”

Subsection 408.3. Delete.

08.00.03.06.15 Section 409 — Site Lighting

Subsections 409.1, 409.2 and 409.3. Delete. Add a new Subsection 409.1 to read: Site
Lighting shall comply with the 2015 International Enerey Conservation Code and
Chapter 59, Montgomery County Code.

08.00.03.06.16 Section 503 — Construction Waste Management

Subsection 503.1(4). Add the following phrase at the end of Item 4: “before a use and
occupancy certificate is issued”

13



MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

08.00.03.06.17 Section 504 — Waste Management and Recycling

Section 504. Delete.

08.00.03.06.18 Section 505 — Material Selection

Section 505. Move Section 505 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.19 Section 506 — L.amps

Section 506. Move Section 506 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.20 Section 601 — General

Subsection 601.4. Delete the last sentence.

Subsection 601.5. Delete.

08.00.03.06.21 Section 602 — Modeled Performance Pathway Requirements

Subsection 602.1. Replace the phrase “Section 602.3” with “Section 602.2.”

08.00.03.06.22 Section 604 — Automated Demand-Response (Auto-DR) Infrastructure

Section 604. Move Section 604 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.23 Section 606 — Building Mechanical Systems

Subsection 606.4. Delete.

Subsection 606.5. Delete the phrase “Except as noted herein.”

Subsection 606.5.1. Delete.

Subsection 606.6 Variable air volume (VAV) fan control.

Add a Subsection numberlng 606.6.1 before the paragraph that begins with the phrase

“Static Pressure sensors.’

14




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

Add a Subsection numbering 606.6.2 before the paragraph that begins with the phrase |
“For systems with direct digital control.” ‘

08.00.03.06.24 Section 607 — Building Service Water Heating Systems

Subsection 607.1. Delete the phrase “and the provisions of this section.”

Subsections 607.2, 607.3. 607.4. 607.5, and 607.7. Delete.

08.00.03.06.25 Section 608 — Building Electrical Power and Lighting Systems

Subsection 608.3(3) Parking garages. Replace the phrase “International Fire Code” in
exception (2) with “Montgomery County Fire Code.”

Subsection 608.5. Move Subsection 608.5 to Appendix A. | ‘

Subsection 608.6. Delete.

Subsection 608.12. Move Subsection 608.12 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.26 Section 609 — Specific Appliances and Equipment

Section 609. Delete.

08.00.03.06.27 Section 610 — Building Renewable Energy Systems

Section 610. Move Section 610 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.28 Chapter 7 — Water Resource Conservation, Quality and Efficiency

Chapter 7. ‘Delete.

08.00.03.06.29 Section 803 — HVAC Systems

Subsection 803.3. Delete.

Subsection 803.4.1(1). Add the phrése “a smoke partition in a fully sprinklered building
or a” before the phrase “1-hour fire-resistance rated construction assemblies” in Item 1.

15




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

08.00.03.06.30 Section 804 — Specific Indoor Air Quality and Pollutant Control Measures

Section 804. Delete.

08.00.03.06.31 Section 806 — Material Emissions and Pollutant Control

Section 806. Delete.

08.00.03.06.32 Section 807 — Acoustics

Section 807. Move Section 8§07 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.33 Section 808 — Daylighting

Section 808. Move Section 808 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.34 Table 903.1 — Commissioning Plan

Amend IGCC, Table 903.1, Chapter 4, reference subsections 401.2. 404.1. 405.1.1,
405.1.1, 405.1.3, 405.1.4, 403.1, 405.1.1, 408.2, 408.3.2 and 409 delete, “unless selected as
an elective in Appendix A.”

Amend IGCC, Table 903.1, Chapter 6. reference subsection 608.6 delete.

Amend IGCC, Table 903.1, Chapter 7, reference subsections 702.6, 702.8, 703.7.7.
705.1.1, 707.15.1, 708.13.8, and 708.14.2 delete, “unless selected as an elective in

Appendix A.”

08.00.03.06.35 Chapter 10 — Existing Buildings

Delete Chapter 10 except Section 1006 — Demolition.

08.00.03.06.36 Chapter 11 — Existing Building Site Development

Chapter 11. Delete.

08.00.03.06.37 Appendix A — Project Electives

16



MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

First Sentence. Replace the phrase “the adopting Ordinance” from the first sentence with
“this code and this regulation.” :

Appendix A, Subsection A102.1. Add a second and third sentence to read: “The code
official shall require the number of project electives specified in Table 302.1 of this
regulation as a minimum. If a Chapter or Section moved to Appendix A is administered
under authority granted to another governmental entity or agency, such as the Maryland
Department of Environment, Maryland-National Capital Park & Planning Commission, or
Washington Suburban Sanitary Commission, then the applicant must exceed the minimum
requirements of code, standards, and regulations as written and enforced by the
governmental entity or agencies, and any such Chapter or Section will not count as a
minimum project elective.

Subsection A102.2. Delete.

Add a new Section A110 to read: “Appendix A includes Sections and Subsections 303,
404, 405, 407, 505, 506, 604, 608.5. 608.12. 610. 807, and 808, which have been relocated
from Chapters 3 through 8 of the IGCC.”

08.00.03.06.38 Appendix B — Radon Mitigation

Appendix B, Delete.

08.00.03.06.39 Appendix C — Optional Ordinance

Appendix C. Delete,

08.00.03.06.40 Appendix D — Enforcement Procedures

Appendix D. Delete.

17



MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

08.00.03.07 [VII.] SEVERABILITY

[7.0] The provisions of this regulation are severable. If a court of competent jurisdiction holds that a
provision is invalid or inapplicable, the remainder of the regulation remains in effect.

EFFECTIVE DATE: This regulation [becomes] is effective on the date Bill No. XX-16 takes effect.

7/;% L. ﬁ/w.)f/he /A(f/n.fj) Yzz/te

Isiah Leggett! County Executive Date

Approved as to form and legality:

&M/Z / Z 7y 3 %Q#«,L 21
Office of the County Attorney Dat

18




Clean Copy



MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

Montgomery County Regulation on:

COMCOR 08.00.03 ADOPTION OF THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL GREEN
CONSTRUCTION CODE

DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

Issued by: County Executive
Regulation No. 21-15

Authority: Code Sections 8-13 and 8-14
Supersedes: Executive Regulation 19-07AM
Council Review: Method 2
Register Vol. 32 Issue 12
Comment deadline: January 31, 2015
Effective date:

Sunset date: None

SUMMARY: This regulation adopts the 2012 International Green Construction Code (IGCC), with
amendments, and supersedes Executive Regulation 19-07AM.

ADDRESSES: Department of Permitting Services
255 Rockville Pike, Second Floor
Rockville, Maryland 20850

STAFF CONTACT: Hemal Mustafa, Manager
Division of Commercial Building Construction
240-777-6226
Hadi Mansouri, Chief Operating Officer
Department of Permitting Services
240-777-6233




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:
Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

BACKGROUND INFORMATION: The Department of Permitting Services enforces Chapter 8
(Buildings) of the Montgomery County Code. This regulation is adopted under Sections 8-13 and §-14 of
the Montgomery County Code. It is a coordinated effort whereby Article VII of Chapter 8 of the
Montgomery County Code is to be repealed under separate Council action and the 2012 International
Green Construction Code is adopted, with amendments, as the energy conservation and sustainable

| building design standard in Montgomery County, Maryland. This regulation supersedes Executive
Regulation No. 19-07AM.

COMCOR 08.00.03 Buildings — Energy Conservation and Sustainable Building Design.
08.00.03.01 PURPOSE

This regulation adopts the 2012 International Green Construction Code (IGCC), with
amendments, apd establishes:

(a) a process to verify that certain new construction and additions comply with the
applicable standard;

(b) standards and procedures under which the Director may approve waivers or
modifications of the IGCC, when compliance would be impracticable or unduly
burdensome and the public interest would be served by the waiver or modification; and

(c) standards and procedures for any enforcement mechanism that the Department
finds necessary to accomplish the purposes of the energy conservation and sustainable
building design standard adopted in this regulation.

08.00.03.02 APPLICABILITY

This regulation applies to any newly constructed, and to any addition to an existing non-residential
or multi-family residential building, including R-2 and R-4 residential buildings (Group R-4 includes uses
such as Assisted Living, Congregate Care, Group Homes and Social Rehabilitation Facilities), that will
have at least 5,000 square feet of gross floor area. This regulation does not apply to any building or
structure exempt under Section 101.3 of the IGCC and Section 08.00.03.06.01 of this regulation.




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

08.00.03.03 DEFINITIONS

For the purposes of this regulation, the following words and phrases have the meanings indicated.
Words and phrases defined and used in Chapter 8 of the County Code have the meanings indicated in that
Chapter.

Addition means an extension or increase in the gross floor area or height of an existing building or
structure. Addition also includes the addition of building components such as electrical and
mechanical systems or elements to an existing building or structure.

Commissioning Plan means the Commissioning Plan approved by the code official.
Department means the Department of Permitting Services.
Director means the Director of the Department of Permitting Services.

Multi-family residential building means any multi-family residential or mixed-use residential
building that has at least 5,000 square feet of gross floor area. Multi-family residential building
does not include a residential care or assisted living building which can house no more than 16
occupants.

Newly constructed refers to a new stand-alone building or an addition to an existing building.
Non-residential building means a building not used as a dwelling.
Non-residential building does not include any:

(1) day care center for 5 or fewer persons;

(2) accessory building or structure;

(3) agricultural building, stable, barn, or greenhouse;

(4)  parking garage that is not heated or cooled; or

(5) other building characterized as a miscellaneous building in the edition of the ICC
International Building Code designated under Section 8-13 of the Montgomery
County Code.

08.00.03.04 POLICY

In May 2011, the State of Maryland authorized local jurisdictions to adopt the International Green
Construction Code as one of the Model Performance Codes. The Department of Permitting Services

3




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originaling Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

supports and recommends adoption of the IGCC as establishing a high performance baseline for energy
conservation and sustainable building practices.

08.00.03.05 PROCEDURES

The IGCC is part of the International Code Council (ICC) building codes family and as such is
subject to the same regulations governing the approval and issuance of building permits, and the
inspection procedures and policies codified in the Chapter 8 of the Montgomery County Code.

08.00.03.06 @ AMENDMENTS TO THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL GREEN
CONSTRUCTION CODE (IGCC)

08.00.03.06.01 Section 101 — General

Subsection 101.1. Replace the brackets and the phrase inside the brackets with
“ Montgomery County Maryland .

Subsection 101.3. Replace Subsection 101.3 with the following: The provisions of this
code shall apply to new construction as it relates to design and construction of buildings
and additions, building sites, removal and demolition of every building or structure or any
appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures and to the site on
which the building is located. Occupancy classifications shall be determined in accordance
with the International Building Code (IBC).

Subsection 101.3. Add the following exception: 5. The code shall not apply to items 5.1,
5.2 and 5.3

5.1. Those low energy buildings that are exempt from the energy requirements of
the current International Energy Conservation Code, including open parking
garages, greenhouses, warehouses, storage buildings.

5.2 Any new building with less than 5000 sq.ft. gross floor area.

5.3 Any addition to an existing building which will create less than 5000 sq.ft. of
additional gross floor area.

Subsection 101.4. Add a second sentence to read: “Appendix A shall apply as amended
by subsection A102.1.”




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012

Number: 21-15

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

Effective Date:

08.00.03.06.02 Section 102 — Applicability

“Montgomery County Fire Code.”

08.00.03.06.03 Section 108 — Board of Appeals. Delete.

08.00.03.06.04 Section 202 — Definitions

after the phrase “such agency has been approved.”

or structure.”

08.00.03.06.05 Section 301 — General

last sentence.

08.00.03.06.06 Section 302 — Jurisdictional Requirements

Subsection 302.1.1. Delete.

Table 302.1. Replace Table 302.1 with the following:

Subsection 102.4. Delete the phrases “the International Code Council Performance Code
(ICCPC)”, “the International Plumbing Code (IPC)”, and “the International Property
Maintenance Code (IPMC).” Replace the phrase “International Fire Code (IFC)” with

Subsection 102.6. Delete the phrase “the International Property Maintenance Code,” and
replace the phrase “International Fire Code ” with “Montgomery County Fire Code.”

Approved Agency. Add the phrase “by the code official or authority having jurisdiction”

Addition. Add a second sentence to read: “Addition also includes the addition of building
components such as electrical and mechanical systems or elements to an existing building

Subsection 301.2. Add the phrase, “including Appendix A” after word “applicable” in the

Subsection 302.1. Delete items 1 and 2, and renumber the second Item 2 as Item 1.




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Originating Depariment: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

Effective Date:

TABLE 302.1
REQUIREMENTS DETERMINED BY THE JURISDICTION
Section Section Title or Description and Directives Jurisdictional
Requirements
Chapter 1. SCOPE
101.3- Detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single- L] Yes X No

Exception 1.1

family dwellings (town-houses) not more than three stories in
height above grade plane with a separate means of egress, their
accessory structures, and the site or lot upon which these
buildings are located, shall comply with ICC 700.

101.3 Group R-3 residential buildings, their accessory structures, and [ ]Yes DX No
Exception 1.2 | the site or lot upon which these buildings are located, shall
comply with ICC 700
101.3 Group R-2 and R-4 residential buildings four stories or less in X Yes [INo

Exception 1.3

height above grade plane, their accessory structures, and the
site or lot upon which these buildings are located, shall comply

with ICC 700.
Chapter 4. SITE DEVELOPMENT AND LAND USE
402.2.1 | Flood hazard area preservation, general [ Yes DA No
402.2.2 Flood hazard area preservation, specific [] Yes <] No
402.3 Surface water protection ] Yes <] No
402.5 Conservation area []Yes <] No
402.7 Agricultural land L] Yes . <] No
402.8 Greenfield sites L] Yes <] No
407.4.1 High-occupancy vehicle parking L] Yes <] No
407.42 Low-emission, hybrid and electric vehicle parking [ Yes D No
409.1 Light pollution control L] Yes <] No
Chapter 5. MATERIAL RESOURCE CONSERVATION
AND EFFICIENCY
503.1 Minimum percentage of waste material diverted from landfills X 50%
Chapter 6. ENERGY CONSERVATION, EFFICIENCY
AND CO-e EMISSION REDUCTION
302.1, 602.1 zEP] of Jurisdictional Choice- The jurisdiction shall indicate a | Occupancy:
zEPT of 50 or less in each occupancy for which it intends to ALL
require enhanced energy performance. zEPI: 50
604.1 Automated demand response infrastructure [] Yes X No
Chapter 7. WATER RESOURCE CONSERVATION,
QUALITY AND EFFICIENCY
702.7 Municipal reclaimed water [] Yes X] No
Chapter 8. INDOOR ENVERONMENTAL QUALITY
AND COMFORT
804.2 Post- Construction Pre-Occupancy Baseline IAQ Testing X Yes [ 1No

6




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Depariment: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

807.1 Sounds transmission and sound levels ‘ Yes [INo
Chapter 10. EXISTING BUILDINGS: DELETE IN ITS
ENTIRETY
1007.2 Evaluation of existing buildings [ ] Yes DX No
1007.3 Post Certificate of Occupancy zEPI, energy demand, and CO?% [ Yes D No
emissions reporting
Appendix A*
A101 ‘| Minimum 2 project electives shall be selected for a building X Yes - [INo
with gross floor area less than 10,000 sq.ft.
A101 Minimum 3 projects electives shall be selectéd for building X Yes [INo
with gross floor area between 10,000 and 20,000 sq.ft.
A101 Minimum 4 projects electives shall be selected for building DX Yes [INo

with gross floor area greater than 20,000 sq.ft.

2 If a Chapter or Section moved to Appendix A is administered under authority granted to another
governmental entity or agency, such as the Maryland Department of Environment, Maryland-National
Capital Park & Planning Commission, or Washington Suburban Sanitary Commission, then the applicant
must exceed the minimum requirements of code, standards, and regulations as written and enforced by the
governmental entity or agencies, and such a Chapter or Section will not count as a minimum project
elective. ‘
08.00.03.06.07 Section 303 — Whole Building Life Cycle Assessment
Section 303. Move Section 303 to Appendix A.

08.00.03.06.08 Section 401 — General

Subsection 401.2. Move Subsection 401.2 to Appendix A.
08.00.03.06.09 Section 402 — Preservation of Natural Resources

Section 402. Move Section 402 to Appendix A.
08.00.03.06.10 Section 403 — Storm Water Management

Section 403. Move Section 403 to Appendix A.




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockyville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Depariment: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

08.00.03.06.11 Section 404 — Landscape Irrigation and Outdoor Fountains
Section 404. Move Section 404 to Appendix A.
Appendix A, subsection 404.1.1. Delete the phrase “municipal reclaimed water or with.”
08.00.03.06.12 Section 405 — Management of Vegetation, Soils and Erosion Control
Section 405. Move Section 405 to Appendix A.
08.00.03.06.13 Section 407 — Transportation Impact
Section 407. Move Section 407 to Appendix A.
08.00.03.06.14 Section 408 — Heat Island Mitigation
Subsection 408.2. Replace the phrase “50 percent” with “40 percent.”
Subsection 408.3. Delete.
08.00.03.06.15 Section 409 — Site Lighting
Subsections 409.1, 409.2 and 409.3. Delete. Add a new Subsection 409.1 to read: Site
Lighting shall comply with the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code and
Chapter 59, Montgomery County Code.

08.00.03.06.16 Section 503 — Construction Waste Management

Subsection 503.1(4). Add the following phrase at the end of Item 4: “before a use and
occupancy certificate is issued”

08.00.03.06.17 Section 504 — Waste Management and Recycling
Section 504. Delete.
08.00.03.06;18 Section 505 — Material Selection

Section 505. Move Section 505 to Appendix A.




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Execulive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Depariment: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

08.00.03.06.19 Section 506 — Lamps
Section 506. Move Section 506 to Appendix A.
08.00.03.06.20 Section 601 — General
Subsection 601.4. Delete the last sentence.
Subsection 601.5. Delete.
08.00.03.06.21 Section 602 — Modeled Performance Pathway Requirements
Subsection 602.1. Replace the phrase “Section 602.3” with “Section 602.2.”
08.00.03.06.22 Section 604 — Automated Demand-Response (Auto-DR) Infrastructure
Section 604. Move Section 604 to Appendix A.
08.00.03.06.23 Section 606 — Building Mechanical Systems
Subsection 606.4. Delete.
Subsection 606.5. Delete the phrase “Except as noted herein.”
Subsection 606.5.1. Delete.
Subsection 606.6 Variable air volume (VAV) fan control.

Add a Subsection numbering 606.6.1 before the paragraph that begins with the phrase
.“Static Pressure sensors.”

Add a Subsection numbering 606.6.2 before the paragraph that begins with the phrase
“For systems with direct digital control.”

08.00.03.06.24 Section 607 — Building Service Water Heating Systems

Subsection 607.1. Delete the phrase “and the provisions of this section.”

Subsections 607.2, 607.3, 607.4, 607.5, and 607.7. Delete.

9



MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockyille, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

Effective Date:

08.00.03.06.25

08.00.03.06.26

08.00.03.06.27

08.00.03.06.28

08.00.03.06.29

08.00.03.06.30

08.00.03.06.31

Section 608 — Building Electrical Power and Lighting Systems

Subsection 608.3(3) Parking garages. Replace the phrase “International Fire Code” in

exception (2) with “Montgomery County Fire Code.”
Subsection 608.5. Move Subsection 608.5 to Appendix A.
Subsection 608.6. Delete.
Subsection 608.12. Move Subsection 608.12 to Appendix A.
Section 609 — Specific Appliances and Equipment
Section 609. Delete.
Section 610 — Building Renewable Energy Systems
Section 610. Move Section 610 to Appendix A.
Chapter 7 — Water Resource Conservation, Quality and Efficiency
Chapter 7. Delete.
Section 803 — HVAC Systems

Subsection 803.3. Delete.

Subsection 803.4.1(1). Add the phrase “a smoke partition in a fully sprinklered building
or a” before the phrase “1-hour fire-resistance rated construction assemblies” in Item 1.

Section 804 — Specific Indoor Air Quality and Pollutant Control Measures
Section 804. Delete.
Section 806 — Material Emissions and Pollutant Control

Section 806. Delete.

10




MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Street. Rockyville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:

Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

08.00.03.06.32 Section 807 — Acoustics

Section 807. Move Section 807 to Appendix A.
08.00.03.06.33 Section 808 — Daylighting
~ Section 808. Move Section 808 to Appendix A.
08.00.03.06.34 Table 903.1 — Commissioning Plan

Amend IGCC, Table 903.1, Chapter 4, reference subsections 401.2, 404.1, 405.1.1,
405.1.1, 405.1.3, 405.1.4, 403.1, 405.1.1, 408.2, 408.3.2 and 409 delete, “unless selected as
an elective in Appendix A.”

Amend IGCC, Table 903.1, Chapter 6, reference subsection 608.6 delete.

Amend IGCC, Table 903.1, Chapter 7, reference subsections 702.6, 702.8, 703.7.7,
705.1.1,707.15.1, 708.13.8, and 708.14.2 delete, “unless selected as an elective in

Appendix A.”
08.00.03.06.35 Chapter 10 — Existing Buildings
Delete Chapter 10 except Section 1006 — Demolition.
08.00.03.06.36 Chapter 11 — Existing Building Site Development
Chapter 11. Delete.

08.00.03.06.37 Appendix A — Project Electives

First Sentence. Replace the phrase “the adopting Ordinance” from the first sentence with
“this code and this regulation.”

Appendix A, Subsection A102.1. Add a second and third sentence to read: “The code
official shall require the number of project electives specified in Table 302.1 of this
regulation as a minimum. If a Chapter or Section moved to Appendix A is administered
under authority granted to another governmental entity or agency, such as the Maryland
Department of Environment, Maryland-National Capital Park & Planning Commission, or
Washington Suburban Sanitary Commission, then the applicant must exceed the minimum

11



MONTGOMERY COUNTY
EXECUTIVE REGULATION

Offices of the County Executive. 101 Monroe Sireet. Rockville, Maryland 20850

Subject: International Green Construction Code (IGCC) 2012 Number: 21-15

Effective Date:
Originating Department: DEPARTMENT OF PERMITTING SERVICES

requirements of code, standards, and regulations as written and enforced by the
governmental entity or agencies, and any such Chapter or Section will not count as a
minimum project elective.

Subsection A102.2. Delete.

'Add a new Section A110 to read: “Appendix A includes Sections and Subsections 303,
404, 405, 407, 505, 506, 604, 608.5, 608.12, 610, 807, and 808, which have been relocated
from Chapters 3 through 8 of the IGCC.”
08.00.03.06.38 Appendix B — Radon Mitigation
Appendix B. Delete.
08.00.03.06.39 Appendix C — Optional Ordinance
Appendix C. Delete.
08.00.03.06.40 Appendix D — Enforcement Procedures
Appendix D. Delete.

08.00.03.07 SEVERABILITY

The provisions of this regulation are severable. If a court of competent jurisdiction holds that a
provision is invalid or inapplicable, the remainder of the regulation remains in effect.

EFFECTIVE DATE: This regulation is effective on the date Bill No. XX-16 takes effect.

ﬁ,,_/t,‘ I3 Firotree [Acﬂiﬁ> v‘7/7-3/‘6

Isiah Legget{{ County Executive Date

Approved as to form and legalit /ﬂ

C/(//éz\ /Zw cé/ 8 Spbin b, 2016

Office of the County Attorney Daté
12




‘sSuIp)ing palIJad @331 g T AlUo papJodad sey Ajuno) Alawosiuoiy
‘970z ‘|HdYy 40 sy a1dsap— uoneayuad uola|dwod 15od € S 3ng Sujfeseq SdUBWIOUSd e Se 9pew 10U S| UONEIISD 3]

'pappp sisoyduwiy

1102 AN — 1uawajels uoiysod dlgnd J9DSN WOy $3d199X3 , )INq 3q Ajjpsmou upd Aom ay3 aaod o3 sBuipying oygnd

J0f SIUBWIWILIOD puD diysiapoa} A1pjduwaxa J0f SanfuaIul Yoiym ffo 3ujjaspg MaU 3|qpin D 3.ip $3po3 sl | ‘Ayunwiiod
aunua ay3 Jof Joolf ay1 bussios 10f Bupuupyd A3jiqouipisns fo 1103y a4} 0 210 S3POI 3jqisuodsau AjjoIuawWUOIIAUD 340U

puD 431y3ypay 1afos ‘sapoo buipjing uaaib Alojppunul ‘apjsuayaidwod atow Uabuolls yum diysiapoaj siy1 3 1dwos
03 jupproduy Afjonba s1 31 ‘wnwiuiw 3y} puokaq ob o} r:muc.. 1oy3 sBuipfing Jof djysiapna] apoa-puohaq yiowiyduaq o}

-Aousguls Sujusejuiew apym suoidasxs aouel|dwod
3|qeuOses. a1e|1oe) 0] ssa30.d Jaalem Bupsixa

2y3 01 SUOISIASL BuIpUSWIWO034 pue ‘sniels Suleyleypuess
Sunejnoie ‘uojjeiuswaidwi JDD] U IsiApe 03 dnois

paubisap uaaq anny g3J1 so yons swiaysAs Guiios Buippng uaaib 3[lyM :100|4 ay1 Buisipy :1apisucd mou Apw suonaipsun{ uoigay

‘gof ay3 J0f 5003 JO 31y 4B 342 YUM, . Sapinoid uazib Buipjing 1oy3 sufauaq anysod ayy Aq payonojun upwal Aow _Smnmu iom e Buiysiigessa Buipnjou ‘ssed0.d uonierusiuajduy
sbuipying o Ajiofow ay3 ‘sapos A103ppupul 3nSUaYaIdwod aiow J36UOL1S INOYUM 'S|001 BUIALIp-3)IDW yind pup ysnd fo jeu m_umz 3P0J SA11I3Y3 PUE PIMS ‘YI00WS B JAISIUjIpE
01IDU3IS 35D3-159q 3Y3 3pinoad wasAs buiips Bujpjing ua3a.16 3poa-puchaq b pup apod Buipjing uaaib b “AbM 4i3y1 UO [[aM 3D 29980 01 5paau I $32unosad syl sey Sdq eyl Wiyuol 'y

oym asoy3 Jof osjp pup ‘Bujuupid Ajiqouipisns uo bupuoqua suolalpsunf fo 1aquunu a61pj 3y3 104, ,"SPIDPUD]S PUD S3p0I
i Buipying uaab fo JuaApD 3y1 yiM 3/qDJIDAD MoU 3Bubyd A101DjnBal PaoUDAPD pup [D3UBWSIIU] BUIIUDAPD 0] Paj3IWLIO3 31D "3P02 M3U 13 YHm pasiwoldwiod Jou s)
Ansnpui Buipying ayz sso.op siaupd sy pub 2G9S ‘@331 o yans swaisAs bupgns buiping uaa1b apoa-puodaq ‘Aipjunjon sureseq Suipjing usaJ3 Azejdwaxa s,A3UN0) 8Y) Jnsu3 g

Jo asn ay3 Buzowo.d 0} uoippPL uf, JUBWSILIS TTOT ABW SN Ul DE9SN 3y} JO SUOIEPUBWIOIDI BY3 YHM JUIISISUDD
aJe suopengal Yelp ayL ‘saugeseq Ayjiqeurelsns Juepodw) Suiysiigeiss spym sjudwaiinbas Alojejnsa. Suioluod ‘suondIpsun BuoqyBIaU YaIM JUR1sisuod 1939}
S2ZIWIUIL 1EY1 ABM B U] 05 SS0P pUE DEOSN dY3 4o suotlisod aijgnd Joud s1saw pasodoad se 309)] Y3 jo uondopy alenbs 000‘0T Ueyl J91ea.3 sBulp|ing 01 sjusWaJinbal
Suipjing uaa48 s,Aauno) Jo adods syl ulelUIB T

"3]qejleAR UIBWSL DBT-ZS
uo1P9s apo) Ajuno) A1WoSWOIN Yim adueplodde ul sBUIp|ing pales a337 Joj sHP3Id Xel Uayung ‘pa8ueydun aie spieme ‘suolpIpsun{ Suloqysiau uf suop st se
Aysuap sueuaq 9)gnd poyisw [euondo 10} JUSWUCIIAUS [EINIBU U3 JO JUSWSIUBYUS PUE UOH3101d 10} SAAIRURIU} ‘apo2 uaa18 3y} Jo sJusWSJINb3J B3] WOy (SBRIUNWIWIOD
usal pue 337 Ajjeaoads) Awunod AlswoFuon
*3p03 10 PJEPUE]S B SE PSPURIU] 10U S| pUB WalsAs Bullel e s| UOIIBIYIISD Q33T "UOREILILAD ur Jejndod ase 18y} WawWaAaiyde Julpjing uaa.3
INON 337 epnjoa.id 10U S0P PUE SIINNILS [BIDISWLWIOD 10} BdUBLLIOLD BUI[RSE] WNWIUIW S9YS]|qEIS JDDI B3 40 uondopy 10} sj9qe| diyssapes) ‘8iqIpald ules 1ey) ssfold idwexg T

NOLLYIND3Y Ag
01 I9NVHD ISNOdS3Y Sda qiLuweans SIN3IWINOD JI18Nnd

m_n_ﬂu NOILLINY1SNOD NIFYD TYNOILYNYILNI ZT0Z FHL 40 NOILJOQY :ST-TZ uoie[nday aniandaxj pasodoid




ANON

"9p02 WNWIUIW 3Y3 Yum saueldurod anoad 03 pasu shkemyed adueljduiod sAljeussyje

‘Jeq ay3 5195 HI9| 3yl ‘spujod Suipieme uo paseq si 1ey: ,wesSold 3poJ 3A0qy,, A1BIUNjOA B Ing Bp0d B Jou S 431
-auijaseq mau e Suilas se uolidope D9 Y3 Jo Hoddns ut Ang uswalels 2qnd e dpew 3g9sN TTOZ Ul “sulfaseq Suipjing
usa.48 Arejdwiaxa ue Burllas ag paspul [[Im AJunod 3yl JID] 3yl Yyum Ajdwo3 01 1318318 10 45 000‘S S1wsload Buninbai Ag

AR
woSuonN
dia

U215 |euoneUIS] 3U2 1dope 01 (Sda) SeIINBS
Sunuwiad Jo Juswnedaq ayi jo uonuaiul 3y3 spoddns
{d3@) uon1a104d |BIUSWILOIIAUY JO juawpedaq ayL

ANON

379 31eJodi00u) 01 uFisep SuiuuiSaq ale ey} spafold a|qeus pue Ajpuasund usisap ul aie 1eyy spafoid
5531pPE P[NOM }f SB 3|qeuoseal S| SIY1 1Y) SaAdlfeq Juswledaq 2yl aouel|dwod 1o} papiacJd st polsad 2. yluow-9 v

*SINOM JURUD} JO SUOIIBAOURI UQ UBPJNG B 9oe|d 10U [|IM ST-TZ YI'snyL
‘sjuswanbas 77D 393W 03 paJinbal aq 0u (1M sSulp|Ing Bunsixa 03 suojiesale pue sEuIp|Ing Sunsie ‘pasodoud sy

-sjuswianbal apo) ASIau3 STOZ 2Y3 199W 10U SI0P | A GITT USAS pUB HnsaJ dLues ay3 SulASILIR AllIeSSaI3U

10U 348 g JSYI0 YIBS JUSLUI{ALLOD UBd SPIBPUEIS OM] BUY] "9POD WNWIUIW a4} Yylm 3ouel|diiod sjensuowsp o1

pasu shemuyied saueldwod aAieUIBLE ‘ploysayl S2uBwIOpad 3Y) S19S DDD] YL *,WelSold Spo) sA0qy, Alejunjoa e 1nq
3p02 B 10U S| 0337 -2uSseq mau e Suies se uondope J39)| 8y3 jo 1oddns ul Ajn4 Bwa1e1s 2lgnd e apew J99$N TTOZ Ul

-aulaseq Suip|ing usals Alejdwiaxa ue Bumas 3 ||Im AJunod ay1 DI 3yt YuMm Ajdwod 03 193e3.18 10 45 000’S staafoid
Surnbau Ag 'uone[nSas sy} Wol) P3G 10U aney:A1unod sy} uj s103foud Auew ploysalyl §s 000°0T 91 Jo asnedsq
-s1o8foid ziT Ajuo o3 pajjdde sey uoledlIuSI 3N Emumv:mE 01 sa1/dde 31 se me Suip|iNg U939 81 BPEISP e AjJeau
J9YY ‘siuswalinbas wnwjuiw sy3 anoge oF o} s1adojaAap 9821n0JUS 01 SNULUOD [{IM SSAILIIUL Y PUE Siseq Alejunjoa
e uo pansind 3q ||3S UeJ UOKEIYILIID pue sjujod g3 ‘SPOI S SPIBPUEIS AJJIGEUIEISNS PUE UO[IPAISSUGD LWALWIUIW

335 [JIM 3091 942 3JIYM "II9] 3y} jo uoidope 3y3 Aq paBueyd 10U 318 UONEIYRISI Q3T YHM P3IRIDOSSE SBAIUBIUL Xe L

‘papuUBWE SE D)9 3Y1 Yum adsueldwod 3o [3A3| Juafeainba ue

15E3] 1B MOYS 1SN PUB $5350.d UOHEILIPOIA BP0 Ino ySnodys spew 34 jjeys tied souey dwod aaileUIaYE U 10) S1Sanbay
‘llom se pansind ag UBD SIBY30 JO $3GO|D USAID ‘UOIINIISUOD U33IH as1dJa1u] ‘g3 SE Yans SSAIleUId]y “papuawe

se 7991 3yl Yum Asua(eainba Suinoud Ag peaoidde aq ‘ss900.1d UOJ1RIYIPOW BPOD BYI YSNoJyl ‘Ued T°68T IVHHSY UM
sauerdwod ||ny Ul Jou 13foid v -)DD| 83Ul Aq papiroad yied soue)dwod |euonndo Jayloue si plepuels T°68T IVYHSY 34l

-waisAs juiod e ySnouyy ucniusoda. 19MJeW pue sulod spieme wia1sAs 8uiies g3 syi pue
‘uy)192 SY3 IIM JOOY BY1 S18S JID| ~310J B dARY @337 PUB DID] 3Y3 Y30q JBY] UOIIUE0ISI 1e3]d Sem 318y} juawdolansp
U] "UOREDINIIBD g3T] pnPaJd Jou saop pue sdueLLIoyad dul9sEq WNWIUIW S3YSI|GRIS DI 34} Jo uondopy

Uo[3BI20SSY
wawdojsaaq
21e)57 |EaY
|eJawwWo)
dOIVN
‘quaplisald
SNz wiL

,depsno

Jeah 931y3 8y) puoAaq aaneusalje panosdde ue 3q a1ayl JI9|

se snNoJoS Se 15e3| 3B 4B SUOJ1eJ1J11I3d Bulpjing US.8 Jejiwis 1o
@331 se Suo| 05 ‘malasl adueldwod T°68T IVHHSY / 20D 103 ssaooud
ay) puesiapun Ajjn} 01 S4q Joj swn Suimo[e ‘yied soueyjdwod
SAIlRUIDYE UB 10§ MO||E 03 poliad Jeah aaly} e 1SE3| 3B pUSWIWOIAL
SM ‘WNWIUIW B 1Y "UOIIBIIII RIS 10 Q337 pNn|Ul p|noMm eyl
T'68TIVHHSY 1] 229) 0} UoIIppPe Uj yied soueldwiod sAReuI)e
ue 104 mojje AJuno) AISWOZIUOA, , SSNOY-UI SIIIAISS MIIASL

3po2 apinold 03 A1eSS3I3U S32UN0S3L 3Y1 pPpe 0} il djdwe S4a
MO|[e 01 PUB T°68T IVYHSY 40 DDD 40 SSDUIAIIIBYS 31 SullI=p
03 s1e9A 991y3 1se3] e Joj yied souerjdwod aAleuIS}e Ue Jo)

mojje 031 |1puno) AJunoD au3 33e4n0dU3 3M ‘WNWIUIW e 1Y -aa1oesd
3Y1 MOU S| SB ‘UOIIEIIHIIIB) JAAJIS A 0337 40 PIOD €A Q3T B Se

yons syled soueldwiod aleullfe 10} Mojje 03 papusWe aq ) asodoud
om ‘uaye} aq uolie|ngay Jus1ind sy noiddes|p 0} UOLIBPUSWILI0IR]
ino pjnous,, ,'aning 3jqeassalo) By} Ul Juswalinbal

SIU3 83BUILIS 0] UOJIUSIUI OU §] 343y} Jey) S| ulpuelsiopun

InQ “seoeds pasea| Joj UC(IBILIHID JBAlIS 337 pue s109foid mau

]2 UC UOKEINYIS) POS ATT] SAAIND3I YIIYM YSD 3U3 ST 135U {B30]
3} Ul S1URU) 35981E[ BY1 JO SUQ :JUSWUISA0S [eJ3pa4'd3q] Se yans
spuesq paziugodal YSnoly} SIUEUS] 0} SNjeA Pue SWBU Bulpling
Usa.48 51E3/UNWWOI 0} 3qe A|2A1R9343 S| Alunwwod 98e10.q
91B159 [28. [Bj2JaWWOD BU) "SBUIp|ing PSYILISI @31 Ul paieso| Bulsq
se |jom se aoeds 39140 a1e1od.02 JIBY3 JO UoleIILSI 33T PNl
yaiym ‘ssuswalinbal Aljiqeulelsns jeulajut saey swiy aleaud

AU :S15)JBL JUBUS} S1RAL] ‘SPUBWSP USALIP-1aYIew SUIMOoljoy
ay3 031 anp wasAs Sunes 337 aY3 Jepun BuiAyued SnuUOd

o1 panbal ag |im spsfoid asay) Jo Auel s}oafoid uofraniisuod
1O1J91Ul IUBUD] PUE ‘UOIIEAOUSI Bulp|ing 35eq ‘JuBWdo[aASp

mau Aue uo uaping anpun juesyudis e Superd Aq Aunod sy

ul swdoeAsp a8einodsIp [jim oue)|dwod Sulpjing uea.s o3 syed
I1eUJBYE SUIMO][BSI] "93R1S JUaLIND SY Ul Uole[n3ay 3y} arolddes)p
o1 [1uno) Ajunoy ays sadun AjBuouis se1deyd Qi / 2d JOIVN 3YL,




INON

9zIuS029) am asnedaq Aem siy) Suipaadold Jou sJe 9\ "SUOIRII}E PUE SUOIBAOUSL 01 DIDI 943 SujAidde aJe suopyaipsinl
12410 ‘wedw Aypigeuteisns nySulueaw S10W B SARY [|IM 3N $399foud 13| [eWS MO|[E []IM JS 000S 1€ PIoYS3Iy} 3uippng ayL

‘spuswaainbal winwiuw ay aaoqe of o1 stadojaasap a3e.nodud
03 SNUNUOD J{IM SBUOZ Y2 3Y3 YSN0.Y] SIIUSUSP SNUOG PUB SIAUIIU] XEY B3 pUE SISeq AJEIUN|OA B Uo pansind
S UBD UOJIRJIILIAD 337 "3POJ Se SPJEpUELS A[iGRUIRISNS PUB UOJIBAISSUOD WNWIUIW 185 M DD9] 3YL  °Z

am se pansind aq ued sJsy1o 10 S3O[D

U939 ‘UORINIISUOD UasID asidialug ‘a3 Se Yyons SaAIeUIR)Y "Papuse se D39 3yl Yiim Auajeanba Sumoid

Aq panoudde aq ‘ssaooid UCIIEIYIPON SPOD U} ;m:,o‘_ﬁ ‘ued T°68T JVHHSY Yum aoue)dwod ||ny ansind 0}
Suiysim 3ou 199f0ad Auy "9 91 Ag papiaoad yied soueljdwod [euondo Jayloue s| piepuels T'68T IVHHSY 3yl T

JUSWIII0US pue

uoneondde wioyun pue Y8noJoys ‘aaI1034d S3|qeUS pue 3seq eyl saysiqeIss DD9] 8YL , uloun pue ygnoioy} ‘@nidas
Si JUSLUIOUS 1B} pue ‘si9Seuew Suipjing pue ‘siado[aaap ‘SI1BpINg 03 PIJeUjWISSIP AISAIIOSYS 3. sjuawaInbau

S9P0J {UOIINIISUOI MBU ||E 1O} SSE] BY] SE JSUURW Ajaw e uy padope ate sapod Buipjing u23.8 pue AS13ud sno1o31

1S0W 3y} 1By} 8Insud 0] $s3204d e dojsasp pinoys Ecjou ay} ‘usisap Suip|ing uaa.s pue Adusiiye-A3J3us o apdeuuld

a3y uasasdal AJuno) sy} Ul panIIsUod sSUp|Ing J0303s lealid pue lignd mau jey) 3insus oy, :sapinoud ueld uolrsIold
21BWI 3Y31 4O $-)33 UO/IEPUSWILLOIBY 'SUOHINPAI [EIUSWSIOU] YUM 0S0Z Aq suolssiwa sed asnoyuaass uj uononpal

208 Ue 104 sf|ed ‘s3uiyl Jaylo Suowe ‘ueld U004 21BWI 6007 AJUNo) AISWOSIUOIA Y. “SUOISSILD sed dsnoyuaaid
10 1edu JuedYUSIS e aARY SBUIP[ING "SSIIPPE 01 J9Y19801 YI0M ISNL 3M Jey Wwa|qo.d [ea. AlaA e S| Sujuiem [eqolD

|
[°PPEM
u
sLIBYL
‘Aayod
|slueqg

|ENJUSAS 33 03 AJISnpul JNo el 03 papaau diysiapes)|
PUB UOIIBAOUL MOYS [|IM SBI851.41S 84N1N) PUB UORUS0ID)
puelq ay] -AjjeuoieusRIUl pue S 3Y1 InoyanoLyl pasn
Ajapim pue Jojeaouul paziugodad e sl 331 puUe Dgosn «
:sjeo8 uonanpal uoqJed pue diysispes| Aifiqeuleisns uo
aAneiul s,Aiuno) AsswoSiuoly 01 s1yauaq Ay |etaAas
mojje jm uondo syl (Auowiisal USNLIM pue elo

Y309 23s) yied asuenduiod sAnELISY[R ue Se 0331 2995N
40 3sN By} MO[[e 0} paisanbal pey SIUBLWILIOD Juanbaly
sS04 Yyoealino dijgnd pue uonrdope apod JJ9)| Y
Juung -syjed aoue)jdwod SAIIEUIDYER SB SpARPUE.)S Je|lWis
pue ‘SaIUNWIWO) U3BJH ‘004 JI! ‘dI31299SN PPV T
-Aouaysisuod 1oy D)D) 03 paledwiod T'68TIVYHSY 404 SHP3
Suio|dxe puawwiodal | "T'68T IVHHSY 40 siudwa.nbal
81 Y1M UOrIeIlLIaA puk 3oueljdwiod 1011 31inbad j|im
SIy), "uope|nSaJ SIY1 Ul SUOIIBIYIPOLL OU SBY YIIYMm T°68T
IVHHSY Smojje 29| 03 yied doue|jdwiod sleusalfe YL T
:a.1e §T-Tg uone[ndsy JDHo| pasodold

5,A3UN07) 33 J0} SUOIIEPUBWIOITY PUB SUOIBAISSAO AN

uo01199104d
|ejus
wuoJiaug
jou
awedag
Aunoj

WeaJls 91sem

01 UOISJSAIP $S3| PUE S[ELI9IBW UONIINIISUOD JO 3SN3I
1318243 S3.NnSuB — Jusiadeue|A] 1SEA UOIIONIISUOD O
Sea1e UBQIN J|qBAlj

3Jow 0} NI ‘sjuswsaed sjgeswiad Jo 3sn pue
‘s9al} 10 S2UNn1onJ3s Aq Sutpeys — uoleS1N puels| 189H o
apoD uofiea1asuo) A3isug jeucrieusau)

Ul S|2A3| JULINI Jano asn ASIsus seonpal —Adlu3 o
:spiepuels Suipjing 1us1nd o3 sjudwancadui Juenioduwl
aJe suoisinold Asy |eiaass jo uoldope ay) n_m_su_tma Uje
-193e218 Jo Y "bs 00001

s8uip|ing 03 safjdde yalym ‘erepuewl 3317 ua1ind ay) ueyl
sSuip|Iing a10wW 13A00 ||IM Ya1ym ‘Jaieals Jo -y 'bs 000°s
s3uip|ing o3 Ajdde m D29 3yl ‘Sda Aq pasodoad sy e
sSuip(ing 9|qeuleIsNS 3J0W pJemoy ssaidoid

|BRUIIUOD 34 ||IM 3JY] ‘S9P03 Sulp)ing Joylo 3| 324 Jesh
-39y 9y} Jo Yed se padojaAsp 39 |IM JD9| 3yl 8snelaq «
*AJBJUN}OA 34 0} papua)ul

AjfeuiSlio sem yaym ‘g3 )| paepuels e 03 a|qessjald

51 9poa Suipjing e se spiepuels Ayfigeulelisns Suindopy «
2291 3y3 jo uopdopy Hoddng

01 Suoseay AsY "Ajuno AlawoS1uoly J0) lomaweld)

apo3 Suipjing ay3 jo Hed se (JDD]) 9P0J UOIINIISUOD




INON

‘uejd U0J1931014 dew|) a2yl ul payiuapl s|eod Ajjigeuieisns s Aunod ayi Suiaaiyae piemoy dais wedyiuss
Ausa e qussaldal Asy) uoldNIISuUoI [BRISWWOD Mmau 03 Ajdde Ajuo syysuaq asayl 3jiym “uonedljdde-piw awes sy} jo sa[nd
ay3 s8ueyo 01 asuadxa pappe pue Ae[ap 2anpollul pINoMm I Julyl am ‘ssasoud ywuad sy3 pue usisap uj a1e jey) s3afoud Jod

"9p02 8y} 01 1udjeAINba 1se3] 1B 9 ISNW A3Y) INg ‘SBU0Z YD) SYI 03 SBIUSUSP SnUOq aY1 10/pue
syyauaq xel ayl dead ||3s uea ‘pansind aq |n1s ued sSuip|ing paRIKad @331 "9p03d DID] 9yl ySnoiy] pazieal aq 03 s1ysusq
31 aJe 853y "BUIUOISSILIWIOI SWAISAS paJinbad 3y o) SO1JI3W 3Wii-|eal apiaoid HI9| 3yl Ul SiuaWaLINbal UOIIRIIHISA BY L

'9%8°LT-ST 01 JSqWinu jeys sasied Do)
3YL "uoneIRl ZTOT Y1 Jano uondwnsuod ASIaua uf uondNPal %OT-L e syussaidal apo) ASseug STOT Syl apo) Abiauz
ZT0Z 341 593us1ajal (FA) 0337 JO UOISIDA JUSIAL ISOW 3y} uang "uopdope Joj pasodoud se pauaxeam Buiaq jou si 9 181dey)

7580¢
AW “2ewolod
sue] adpug

slled 0056
qooer uAlaal

'spJepueis D)o

MdU 3Y1 199W 0} paJiinbau aq Alunod syi Aq panoidde Ajny
u33q 194 10U aaey eyl sSuIp[ing M3U |{B 3)I] p|NOM | »

‘v Xipuaddy 03 psaow aq sjuawalinbal

9 UOI198S 33 JO 3UOU JBy} pue ‘Alojepuew spew

94 D291 843 JO 9 UOIIIS B.1IUS 34} 835 0] 31| PINOM | o

© suoisiaoad 3791 3yl Jwswsduwi

031 Moy ules| 01 SI3p|Ing Joj paJinbal awnl sy} uo Aj|os
puadap pue s|qissod se Hoys se 8q p|noys Ae|sp 1ey3 ‘awinn
Jo pouad e uano Ul paseyd aq 031 s1 DJ9| 3y3 4| "3jqissod

se uoos se pardope aq DJ9| 2y} 935 03 || PINOM | «
:Ajjeaiydads

‘wa[qoJd ay3 aajos djsy o1 Aem

poo3 e s| quaidyya AS1sus aq o3 s8uip|ing mau jje Sulinbay
3siom 8umad pue Alljeads e s1 a8ueyd ajewiDn ‘Auno)
AswoBwop ui D391 3yl Sundope poddns Aj8uos |
*Aluno) Alswo8iuo ui D9

3y Jo uondope pasodoud 3y} uo JUSWIWIOD 0} A} p|NOM |

~ aJowifyeq 30 A1ID SY3 USAS 10 1013SI SY] S SLIES BY] JOU DJE SIDJeU [elua)
Auno) ArawoSiuoy 2yl 18yl PUB SUOIIEISYE JO SUOIBAOLIDI U SJUSLLISIAUL 38In0dsIp 1YSIW Jeyl usping [epueuly Jo3eals
€ 9 PjnoM 114043134 03 JuSWa.INba. 3Y) PUE SUOIIBAOUSJ UO $1oBdWI SY1 PUE SUORDIPSUINT 811 SUoWE SSIUBJBINP 316 33}

*s|euoissajoid usisap pue
s13umo 3ulp|ing Joy suondlpsun( 1ayio Suowe Adua1sISUOD
urelal jIm SIYL S 000°S pasodoud ayz jo nay| ul
45 00007 30 ploysaiyl azis Sulp|ing SLwies sy} Ulejuie g
‘a337 pue Dg9SN 01 pal} aJe suolisod aoejdiadsew
aAlledwod pue ‘syuswalinbal ases) ‘saotnos Aunba pue
199p Y10g WOy SJUSWHWWOD [ejpueuly Ji2y) *q337 pue
Dd DSN 01 pan aJe 1.yl saA1193[qo pue sjeod Ayjiqeurelsns
YUm 22uas94d [BUOIIBUIDIU| PUB |BUOIIRU SARY 1BY] Jl{gNd
pUue a1ealld Yloq sjueual aaey siadojaaap Suipjing Auey «
‘a1n1ny ayy
ul paseaJsu] se sa1891..1s G331 8yl Yum Adualsisuod daay
117 28 9SN YUM Uord3uLod S|yl Bujuleluleiy ‘|ewlou
M3U YY) Se 0497 19N Jo |eod




3INON

309} 2y 4o syuawanbal apod aseq ay1 aaoqe o 01 s1adojeasp
2524N02U3 03 BAUIIUO [[IM SSARUIIUI Y} puE Siseq Atejunjoa e uo pansind aq [|13s UED UCIIRILILISI 43T ‘OpO2
Se spIepuels AjlJIgeulelIsns pue UoJ1BASUOD WiNWUIW 19! 1M 5791 9Y1 apym “uondope apod Suimoj|o} Slqe|iene
30 01 9NUIIUOD ||IM UOIBIILISY 03T YUM PIRID0SSE SBIHSUSP SNUOQ PUB SIAUIDUI XBL ‘PIPUSWIE SE 3D 34}
yum oueljdwod Jo [9A3] JUS[eAINbS ue 1sed] 18 moys umsrf pue ssa30.d UOIIEdYIPOIA BPOD INO YSnoiyy apew aq
[leys yied daueyjdwod sAREUIDYJE UE Jo§ S1Sanbay *[|am Sse uolyse) Swes ayl ul pansind sq UED SJBUL0 10 S3qOID
us31o ‘UsIIONIISUO) US.D) IslidIsIug ‘QaFT Se yans SSAIEUIR)Y "PapuaWe se J)D| SYl YIm Aduaeainbs Suinoad
Aq panoidde aq ‘ssed01d UoIEILIPOIN 3POD 3y} Y3noJyl ‘Ued T°68T IVYHSY Uum aoueydwon [jng ansind 0}
Buiysim 1ou 13foad Auy *309I 9y1 Aq papiac.d yied wu:m,_anu {euondo Jayjoue s| pJepuels T'68T IVHHSY 3YL
179 a1eodiodu) 03 udisap SujuuiSaq a.e 1ey) sysfoid 8jqeua pue AjJua.Lnd ugdisep ul aJe leyl s199(01d ssauppe

pINOM 1 Se a]qeuosead si sILl Jeyl s3nalfaq uswpedag ayL -aoueldwod 1o} papiroid s pouad 32818 Yuow-9y e
*U0I323J1p 2By} U] dais Juedyudis e s1 D9 Y} pmc%cm Ajpeo.q alow asuewioysad 3sied 01 SWIISAs paseq

-3p03 pIEMO] UOI1ONJISUOD BUIp|ing 2A0W O3 S1 995N mﬁ 10 UO[IUSIUL SUIpUNoy B 18U} J2UUdg I YiMm 3a.8e M e

‘1

anin
snjuawl
108594014
P8HYY
llauuag ydjey

wasAs d337 ua41no & yaiym Suinp padinbal st pouad
[RUOIIISURLY B JBY] 2ABI[3] | ‘@SN U] mou Q3T JO SUOISIIA
ay1 01 pasedwod DI 81 4O UoIsIaA pasodoud siyy

1O SSBUAIIIBJJD SAIEISL 31 UO SURUSWIWOD INOYUM »
"1eY1 saop DD pesodoud sy aAsieq

| "AjpeO1q 210W FIUBWIOLS 3]l 0] SWIISAS paseq
-ap032 pJeMO] UOIIONIISUOI Suip|ing A0W 03 SI D99SN
3ly2 40 SUOIIUS3UL SuIpUNO) 3] JO BUQ “IUBWBLNbAL

e se ‘q331 5,099SN ‘Plepuels [euonelidse ue Jo

asn ay saJinbal uoiiengas Suip)ing uasls SUnSIXS BYL e

INON

*SJUBIIOD dJOIYN 01 sasuodsas os[e 935

*51503 UOIINJISUOD |210] DY} JO %0Z PAIBWIS3 UR JO sBulnes

3[4 31| U 3NS3J % JO SIS0 UORINIISUOI PIPPY "S1507 3IUDUIRUIDU pUD Bunpiado panpal o3 anp 1aybpy sawiy 0T-S 39
Inm syfauaq jprupulf uiay Buol [jpJano ay3 INg SISO PIPPE %Z-0 S8esone Aew uBisap paiel3aju| :91L1S SSIPNIS [BUOILPPY
-51503 [euoljesado Ul UORINPaL %Z°2-9"T *SUOISSIWS DHD Ul UORINPaI %9°GZ-%0"0T 3503

AS15U3 Ul UON3NPaJ %0 HZ-%9°07 "9sN ASIau@ U] UOHINPaL %5 6T-%T ST poLad Jeah OT e 4o} 3pNnjouod LSIN Aq saipnis
10V sSulp|ing 85UBWLIONSd YSIH puelAlely 841 193W 0} UOj1ed|IB) pue oue)dwo) JBANS 3T

U1iMm pale[IoSSE S1503 Sulonpal Jo sueaw e se 309) ay3 seas :uodal €107 JeY3 Ui [1PUNOD Suipjing USBIY puelAley syl

947 3snf sem

U243 SuIp|INg JO 51502 PIey 3U3 B[IYM 9%E°Z JO 9BeIOAR UB PIPPE UO{1EI|J11I3 0337 104 BUO|R 53507 1OS SMOYS Vs$o aya Aq
ApRNIS ¥ "UOINIISUOD JO 1503 3Y] §0 %G 03 dn 10} JUNOIJE UCIIEIYILISI 0ITT YHM PIIBIO0SSE 53502 3Y1 JBY) S1B21pUl SBIpNiS
“p UOISIIA Q337 40 J0 DD STOZ AIOIEPUBLL MOU 3U) YItM PRIR[DOSSE S3S03 3] 199]J3J 10U PIP PUE & UOISISA 0337 159M3U
a3 Jo saueldwod apo) uoneAlssuo) ASIU3 [euoneuISlU| STOT SY1 jo uoidope 0} Jo11d sem ogr Aq paplaoid maiaaL 3yl

~dio) ogr
‘Ja8euely
Aljiqeureisns
‘Buo eayssar

“uo11e31113d Bulp|ing U3a.48 Alied pig Jo) SPUBWSP 1dJew
pue JURUS) JBPISUCI puk S$3004d MBIAD) Bdueldwod

979| ay3 dojansp A[|n} 01 S4q Joj swiy Suimole

‘sjeod Suip|ing w43 s,A3unod a3 Suaaw 1oy syred
9oueljduWIod 93RUISI|E MO]|E P|NOM 1B} UOISIIA B JO JOARY
U] W04 TUS.4ND SY Ul uoiiein8aJ sjyl aacaddesip o1 |1ouno)
Auno) ay3 sadin ssjuedwio) HGF sYL ‘UISNOUOI Uf
‘uonediya)

337 01 21294 $1509 SNSJSA 1500 U] 9583J0U) JURdIIUSIS

e 9q pjnom 779 Aq pa1elssaIaL 31509 UOIIINIISU0D dY)
1BY1 P31BJISUOLLBP SISA[UE SIU] "SdQ Wou) 3s3nbal uodn
‘sTOZ Ales ui ogr Aq Ayunod ayi 03 papiaoid uoizdope
909 40 speduw] 1503 2y} Jo sisAjeue sy3 woJj sBuipuly

3y 91131121 puE Ajie 03 31| PIom am ‘Aj[euoiippy
‘asuadxa pue aw} Sujppe ‘ss3204d UOIIEIH1IRD

a331 43 ySnouyl o8 pue D] 3} JapuUn Pamsinal aq

01 syadojanap aJinbas pinom 31e1S 1U31IND S3) U1 uonensal
3y1 aJojaJay] ‘quswainbal e aq 0} 3NURUOI [|IM
uonesyta) g3 suoljeiodiod [eqojd pue [EUCLIEU J3LI0
pue ysH Se Yons Sueual 2103 1eJile 0} sjuswdopasp

104 19p10 U] “AjuNnwuIod Juswdo[aAsp 3y Uo uspIng
juesiyusis e 2oejd pinom uopie[ngaJ auy3 jo Jed se syled
Ioueljdulios SARRUISI[E JO UOISNIOXS 33 1By} J31deyd
QN/2a dOIVN 33 jo uoiisod ay} spoddns sajuedwo)
ogr 9yl ‘(279]) 8poD UOIIINASUOD USIY [BUOIIBUIRIU]
Z1.0Z 341 JO UOISIDA papustle-sdd e jo uondope ayi 1oy
ST-TZ "ON YIOW suoneinsay (,5dd,) s221A195 Bunywiad
10 Juswuedaq pasodoid Ajusdal 3y 03 asuodsal uj




INON

‘UE|d UDJ3IBI0.4 dIRWI[) BY1 U1 PayRUap| sjeos Alljigeurelsns s Alunod ayl
Suiaaiyoe piemoy dajs Jueoyusis Alan e Juasaidal Ay} UOIIINIISUOD [BIDISWIWOD mau o} Ajdde Ajuo s1ijouaq asayl afiym

‘Ue|]d UoI1I910.d d1ew]|D Y1 Ul paLyIuspl mjom Ajiqeutelsns s,Alunod ay3 Suiasiyoe paemo) dajs Jueayusis
Asan e uasaidas A3yl uolansU0d [elaJswILod mau o} Ajdde Ajuo s1yauaq ssayl sliym -uoies)jdde-piw swes ay 4o sajnJ

ay1 28ueypd 01 asuadxa pappe pue Aejap 93npoul pjnoMm 1 julyl am ‘ssadold ywiad ayy pue usissp ul aJe Jeus spafoud Jog
I

| .

-3p03 By 01 1uajeAINba 1583] 18 99 ISNiL ABY] INq ‘SL0Z ¥ BY1 0] SIIISUIP SNUOG ALY Jo/pUE

s1yauaq xe} ayl dead [jis ued ‘pansind aq |13s ued sBuipjing payiuad 4331 "3Pod ID9 Y1 YSnoly} pazijeal ag 0} s1yauUq
a3 ale 953y SuIUOISSILUWOD SWAISAS paJinbal ayy 104 SILIBW SWII-[ead apiAcid DJD| BUl Ul SIUBWSIINDAL UCIIEDIIRA SYL

‘%8 L1-ST 01 J)aquinu

1843 S35 D)D) 9YL "UolIeIdH ZTOZ Y1 JaAo uojiduunsucd ASISUS U] uoanpal %0T-L e s1ussaldal spo) A3ssu3 STOZ 3yl
*apo) ABusuz ZT0z Y1 s9ousJa)al {A) 43317 J0 UoISIaA Evum: 1sow ay1 uaA3 ‘uondope Joj pasodoud se pausyesm Suleq
10u s1 g Jaydey) (PA) Q33740 UOISISA JUSIBI JS0W Y] uUIAT "uondope Joy pasodoid se pausyeam Bulaq 1ou si g Jaidey)d

aAlg
Iemdaaq
6L
SSI9M
21eMm

*SpJEPUBIS JDD] M3U 3Y) 192w pInoys

Ajunod ayy Aq panoudde Ajjny usaq 394 10U sABY LPIYM
sSuIpjing mau [je ‘1I9AMOH 'DJ9| Mau Byl woly ydwsxs
3¢ p|nom paue}s 10U UolIdNIISUoD Inq pasosdde Afny
uaaq aAeY yaiym sSulp|ing Jeyl S[qGeUoseas SWass i '€
‘suolsiaold DD 3y

juswajdw) 01 Moy ulea| 0} SIDPJING 1o} paainbals swi ayy
uo Ajajos puadap pue ajqissod se Hoys se aq pjnoys Aejap
1eY31 ‘@wil Jo poutad e Jaao uj paseyd aq 01 S1 3D Yl 4
'y xipuaddy 03 pasow 8q

sjuawaJInbal g uondss ay1 Jo suou eyl pue ‘Alojepuewl
3PEW 3q JD9] Y1 JO 9 UOIIS 3UNUS U3 38y} 35938NSs | °T
‘suoIIsassns asJuy aaey ‘Ajjeayydads

‘wia)qoud ay3 anjos djay 01 Aem poos e s} s8uip|ing
|eioJawwWwod URPIYd Sup|ing pue ‘Ayjesd e S| Sujusem
leqo[9 “Awuno) AsawoBiuow ui 3791 ay3 unidope poddns
ABuons | "Ayuno) AsswoSiuo Ut DJ9) syl Jo uolrdope
pasodoud 3y} UO JUSWILIOD SIY] 1310 03 Y1} pjnoMm |

] syuswaanbaus

S} JO M3IIA3I BAIsUOdSal ‘Ulew BY} Ul ‘pue paseq peouq
‘91e4aqI[@p SH SNUUOI ||IM Juswniedag Syl JeY) ISnJ) pue
20D 8Y3 JO UOISIBA STOZ SY3 JO UOREIDPISUOD Al1ed J0dXxa
1 (€9 wouy ¢ 10 € ‘2) v xipuaddy wouy paiinbalt sanase jJo
Jaquunu ay) aJde se ‘(£) may ale (1°Z0€ d[qel) siuswalinbai
UoIPSUNS 3y3 1ey) Ui ‘auo Buipuewsp Alydiy

230U SI D91 843 Jo uoisiaA pasodoid syl 1yl ansi|aq | «
*sy03f04d 43| jeWS JOJ 384E)

Ajreuoipodold pue JuejSUOI SWOIBY 0} PUI) SISO0I YOS "}
01 103(gns spew aie s1a3f0.d ||ews AJ9A 810)8q {BIIUSSSS SI
spafoud 1a81e] U 3P0 SIYY YHM 33uUB1I3dXD - UOIIINIISUOD
uj $1509 pJey pue uB|ssp uj $1503 3Jos yioq sasies Sulp|ing
uaa.8 1ey3 uossenb ou st i3y "pouad Jeuoinsue

B JOJ PBUIEIBI 3G JS 000°0T 40 ploysaJyl aLind

By1 1Y 35988NS | OS ‘MOU WIOIY SYDDM XIS SPOD MdU
AjsJius ue jo jJuawadioyus uappns ay3} Auedwoddse 01 mo|
001 Si P|OYS34Y3 SIY2 181 “JSASMOY ‘SA31[3q | "UO1IINISU0D
PaYIPOW JO M3U JO JS 000S O3 dduerjdwod jJo pjoysay}
PS19MO] 33 Ui PILI3}J3L S| B|qRUIBISAS UOIINIISUOI

511 JO SJ0W Supjew 03 JUBLUWWOI 5,AUN0D) BYL »
'3]qeuAsu| pue

aelidoidde st 339] 2y 03 UOISISAUOD BY] 3ABI(3] | Ing
*yied soueljduod aAnkeulS) e Ue sk paldadde aq ued Sunjel




ANON

' ‘yamouas 1S1|BSIDAIUN 3y} a.e s31Is Bulp[ing pue SUOISSIWa DHD JO 221n0s }saBle| 3|3us
aed[e 59} pue suopesiuasud usdAxo Jaysiy ‘uononposdas ajpim wo 1edw)] padnpas YUm sAemidlem pue swiealls ueueyun ayy aJe s8ulpjing ‘Aguno) ano u| -Aujenb Ja1em 03 SUOISSIWR (DHD)
Ino Supe1UB Jazem Jo Sunjesadiual oyl seaNPaS ULN] Ul SIYL | *s90e4ns snolalad saainbal U se yound 1ajemules U] 5asealdsp | peoy JaAlY — ses asnoyuaalg wouy SujBues sa8uajieyd AljigeuleIsns s Ajuno)

JueaiudIs J0J Smoj|e }f uolippe uj "peoj 8uij00d mE:W._mEE:m 3y3 JO %08 03 dn 104 JUNOIJE UED YOIYM Saunjesadwal
Jie pasesuour Ajjedjjewelp woJj Suiynsa swajsAs 8ul[0od uo peo| ayl saanpal Aj3eaun "uoleSIuN puels| 3esH 8ov
219 quawaaed ‘sBulp|ing ‘s|tos ‘saaJ1 wm yons jyusawdoaaap aits Bulp|Iing JO %5/ UeY] $S9] 10U Wealls

91SEM |BUOIIPE.T Y} WOJY LSAIP 01 JUSWSIINDSI 9Y1 SIALIP YI[um “uawadeur|y a1sep SuS Suiping 9op ‘v Jeideyd

:s8up|ing Jo spedwy ay) Sunediiw spJemol spuawanotduwl Jofew aJe Suimoljo) ayL

-uswpedaqg 9y jo Ayjoyine ayy
O BPISINO PUE ISSM 10 IddINIA SE Yyans sapuade 13430 Jo AJIOYINE 3y} 03 PSTHWIWOD JJE JBY) IO ‘UO[IESIDAUND IS0}
pue jJuswaSeuew JO1EMWIO0IS SB Uans sme| Suilsixe Aq passalppe Jays aie jey) seale AJauapl 03 JDD] Y} JO MIIAI Ul
[njay3noy3 usaq sey juawnedaq ayL “piemoeq dais e m_w uondope pasodoid ay} 1ey) sau8e jou saop Juawedaq syt

82404 jyseL [e
uawuolAuUg
‘Qan1uwo)
Bupiells
:90nug
Aausep
‘1I9SOIN
a110/4eYD
‘zumoqa
3aer ‘sslop
I31em

Asawosjuoly jo 8dods |jny ay1 ssauppe o3 [enualod ayl yum — puoiaq
puB ‘@2ueusIuiEW ‘Uo1IeI9do ‘UoIIaNIISUOD 0] UBISap WOy — als

pue 128[01d UORANIISUOD DIIUB BY1 JO} SusWR.INbI Aljiqeueisns
WNWIUIW 3pN[aul 0} 8p0d ABLISAO [SpPoW 1841 31 S1 D9 ZTOZ YL
*MO]3( UBAIS suoseal Joj sjeo8 9sayl saalyoe Jou

S90P GT-TZ YT HLJp 1US1INI BY] ‘JISASMOH "98ueyd a1ewl|d ssaippe
pue juswuolnus 1no aaoidwy 03 suopesiqo [e8a) s, Aluno) 3yl
louoy pue J3pe3| [BIUSWUOIIAUS U se suojielidse s,AJuno) ay1 18w
A[nJ} 03 GT-TZ UOiIRNS3Y 9A1INIBXT 3jgeus 0] UOIIUSIIE S1e|pawiw|
JnoA 28in pue apo) UOIINIISUOD UTRID) [BUOIIBUIDIU] ZTOT

3y jo uondope s,Azuno) Arswosiuol Jo Loddns ul Suilum sie s

INON

*SUIBIUNOJ SAIEI033pP PUE UOIIESIL] 10} J91eM PIIID[[09 U} JO 35N UL S] UOWIWOD
ssa7 "sJesd 4o Jaquinu e Joj Aauno) A19WoB1uopy Ul 3Sh UCWWIOD Ul U2aq Sey UoRI3jod pue Sujisaniel Ja1em ‘jdwexe
104 Jejjiwey aq Aew sjuedjdde yorym yum Ajunod syl Ul ssaljoesd UCEBAISSUOD JS1EM 316 218U3 1eU] 910U OS|e 90

-Bulpjing B 0} 321AISS JAMBS 1O J31BM SB UINS ‘s1ay10 jo [eacadde sy aainbas Aew 1ng sywaad Suipping 03 81e3. 1y
SJa11BW J3Y10 104 MoU s90p 3 se 1sn[ ‘AousBe Buiroidde m:t ya0m Jjim juedtjdde ay 1eyy ‘AdusBe Jayyoue o uonaipsinf
23 Japun s|jej 18y} 8AID8|8 ue sesodoud juedidde ue wrmEs 184} PUE UOJ}BUIPIOND 10} P33U € S| 3133 eyl aiedpnue

/M "S9AIBJR 199f0ud se v xipuaddy 03 sjuswaiinbal asoyy ,m:_>oE Aq S80UBISWNIJI SSOU3 SS3Ippe 0} pardwalie sey pue
so1poq A103e|ngs1 JoY30 40 AJLIOYINE BY3 JapUN |84 18yl 1I5| 3Y3 JO suolsiroad s1e 313y} Jeys sazjugooal Juswipiedaq syl

JO1BUIPIOOD
uoJ199uu0)
SS01D

pue Sujuueid
3p0) ISSM
‘Aappng woj

*3A0(E SUISIUO0D PI1e[al 3Y) 1o 1ujod 01 paluem

Aidwis | *uay0.q J0u a.e s8al pasodold ay) ‘@a049194)

pue apo2 JSSM J9pun [[B} 10U [JIm SWISAS uiejunoy
JoOop3No 10 uonesiul aeym sisixa yied e jeyr azijead | (v
30U ale Asy3 uaym ‘sjqesosdde Ajjpeal osje aue

pue J31em a|gejod Yum 38ujwos ued SWISAS uleIunoy o
uojiesiul 1eyy Jo djqeaoidde Ajipeas pue spood styl sspun
paJlinbai aie sasn-aJ Ja1em Joy10 Jo ‘JsiemAels ‘Bulisamiey
J91eMUlE] 1BY) SAS]|9q 01 PIJSIL 4 ABL oYM SIBWOIsSNd
u1eIDD 03 Jie) 20U S| {S)IUdLUBIELS LINS JO 9IUISqR 1Bl [93)
| *(suoniejngaJ asn-a. 1o1em Alessaoau sy psieSinwoid
sey AJunod 3y} [13un) Jajem 3|gqelod-uou Jo Sasn/$92Inos
J3U30 Uo wnuojeiow udisap-isenb e Jo uopuaw ou ‘osjy
*3AO0(e SWid]! 10} SUOIIBIIWI| JUS1INI BY] SS3.dX3 10U Op
suo[1e|ndal pasiAal 9Y3 Jelj) paussIued We | .0 (g
‘uoeAlasqo yijeay a1jgnd |esauasd e isnf ‘onssi

Buigwind e JoN ‘suiejunoy 4o uoliesiL 03 Ajddns o) ajes S|
Ja1em pajsaAley Jelj) aInsua o3 sjuswalinbal suonesado
10 UO13IRJUISIP ‘Suoljeliw| a8elo)s ‘spiepuels Aljenb
Ja1eMm syoe| Aunod 3yl 1ng *aA13099 108foJd e Se Uo[193[as
[e1uajod Joj v xipuaddy 01 paAow sem f0p Uonas (2
‘surejunoy aaey |iim ssuipjing

M3} PUY "SYIUOLW JSJUIM Ul Alzejnarped ‘puewiap uoliediul
"A BWN|OA Utel SULISPISUOD UBYM Sulliwij IBYMILIOS

S| JBYL "SUIBIUNO} 10 UOiIRSILl 1O} 5] ||IM SISN 3jgemo][e
Suiuiewal Ajuo ay3 os ‘pa13|ap 3ulaq st £ Joidey)
‘J9ABMOH "JuSWaBeuew J31EMWIOLS UM |ESp 01 [00)
3|qelA e si Sulisaaley Jalemulel Jey) SIajUl £0p UoIAS (T
19P02 3} Ul U[RWS] Jey] SWa)l ISn-al

Jaiem jo 3|dnod SY3 10} UISIUOI JNC OYd3 01 }l| PINOM |




“JueaRIUSIS 24 [[IM HOWOI Juednado

pue 3[2A2 8y Suipjing ‘uondwnsuod AS1aua uo Pedu w:._. ‘pepus)ut pue pausisap a1am Aayl se Suluo)auNg dJe SWwaisAs
s} pue Sulp|inq ay1 1Y} SIURINSSE JO [2A3] 1S3Y31Y wﬁ, apiaoud 03 Sujuossiwwod Asuednado 1sod se [[am se Asuednaoo

01 Jotid Suip[ing aJ3us 3y} JO BUILOISSILILIOD 3y} ._ow ssaoo.d pajielap AJaA e ssuysp siyL ‘Suluoissiwwo) g 191deyd

ﬂ -Ajljenb s1e 1oopui

sanoudwi Aj3eaio “Jie Joopul 8yl puUB SWaisAs 3yl ul mmum_w_u_tma 291} JO JUNOWE Y} SIINP3I PUB M3PJILI/P[OW JO Yol
SIUaA31J "Swd1sAs Suljpuey Jie 3yl pue 3ulp|ing ay3 ut mum_sEzuum ued yarym saje[noiuied syy Sziwulw 0] UOHINIISUOD
Suunp Suip|ing ay3 Jo UOIIERIYY JO) SJUBWIIINb3I mm_b:umn 1YL "uondNIIsSUo) Sulng swalsAS JVAH JO UONI101d €0S-TOS
-s8uip[ing Joy aouewiopad Adiaus nw>oEE_ 10 UOIIEOYLIBA B} Ul JuSWwanodw) Juedyiusdls e pue sseao.d

SutuoSSILWOD [BUY 243 Ul d2)s 1511 Y1 ST SIYL "SuorIpuod usisap je sjesado 01 pauny pue pa3sal aq swa)sAs Buipjing
ay31 12U Uonadsu {euy Joy Apeal pue a13]1dwod si 3ul :n ay1 82uo 1oyl salnbay “Buluoissiwwo) swalsAs ASIsua TT9

, *Hojwod Acuednddo

SE ||oM SE SUDISSIWS ZOJ PUE UORINPaI 35N AS1US Uo s1aeduwl JUedYUBIS AJBA BARY [|IM SIYL -a8eyea] JIE 10} P3Isal 3]

s3ulpjing ||e saunbay -adojaaus Buip|ing ay: ul EwEmso.a,E_ 90T JO Wnwjuiw e saInbay 'swa1sAs adojeAuz Buip|ing 509
-juswaBeuew A31au2 Bulpjing se |[am Se Bupjiewydusq jo pedwl

w_._u mc_u:m_._:mSmpzn_bcou___Bw_uoum_f\EEmEa mc_vt,mE;u:wm m:_v__:fmzno_mum%z:m_mmfﬁ::oum&“mu:_mmuoz
‘pausisap se a1esado 03 mw::_m:ou pue Supesado s| Suip(ing 8y} 1BY1 UOREIYIISA SdpIroid pue
Suip|ing syt Joy JJeWYdUSQ Y3 YsI|qelsd 0} sdidy siyL '3 n_.a 3y} pue sjueUs) ‘sisumo Bulp(ing 01 d|qe|ieae spew 3q 1snw

uorewLIoyul syl -Aejdsip alignd e 01 uoieWLIOU] J1BY} quoE 1BY] SWH1SAS SULI9IAW PI|RUS-BIEP JO UOIIE|[RISUI BY] OS[e .

Snmmabvmo_wym_owcmuumEmEmugmm:os:n:um_u Lw\s,oa vpocm_mwuw;;_:oyocuwwu:_u:_mE._.thoamhn:mvm‘_oe:oE
‘painseaw aq uolewe|oal ASisus Aue pue :o_ﬁ:noj asn AS1aua s8ulpfing au3 Jeyy Buninbaa Ajjediseq ‘uoi3das apod
siy3 yum Ajldwiod jjeys ASsaua Suiwnsuod 8uipjing Aue umf mmumv:mE Suruoday pue ‘Buuionuoly ‘Suialsi ABlaul $09

, *SUOISSIWS OO Ut uolanpal

98-S puk apod ASIaus ZT0T 9yl J9n0 co_uaE:m:ou AS19uD Ul UONINPRI %OT € I5ed) 1e S| siyl. “uoidwnsucd AdJaus
oJaz-19u Suilesipul 049z yum sutod QT 3|qissod e jo uso 15 st auljaseq |43z ayy ‘Ajiuaun) 'sadAy Aouednaso uo paseq
(1d32) xopu1 9suewiopad ASiaus-0iaz e sapiro.d SUOISSIWA 970D PIINPaY PUE JaMOd 3ead ‘@aueulioysd AS1aul 209
*AS12U3 40 3N DAIPBYYS 10 SANS JBY1 pue sBuIP|INg 4o suoliesado pue SUIUOISSILILIOD ‘UORINIISUOD ‘uisap ay1 ss1ensal
uondas siy) “1oedw 1saieald ayy sdeysad sey yoiym 3__m,:,o auaydsouyy pue ‘Aousipiyl ‘uonessasuo) Adleu3 g Jedeyd
-Aqienb e Joopu ||eISA0 9yl ssacidwi) pue Bulp|ing SY3 40 ajlj S2IALSS BY SPUIXT "3UnPnNs

33 03Ul UOISNJIUL BIMISIOW JO uoiIuSA3Ld Y3 Joy mu:mEE_:cE saypads "|oJ1uo) aanision adofeauz Sulp|ing £0S

‘yseti um._wc_mﬁ,_ou 25u0 sjelsaiew jo Suisodindal ‘asnal ‘Buyoiras ‘Suidelnodul

“940S UBLJ1 $S9] 10U JO S1SEM UOJONJISUOI JO UOISISAIP WESI]S 31Sem Sauinbay “JuswaBeuely 31Sem UOIdNIISUO) E0S
21190115 3Y1 UIYHM MBP|IW pue pjow Jo pooyiay|

aU) S9ONpPaJ puUB JUSIU0I BINISIOU JUBISUOD SUlBIUreW ‘Slepialew Bulpjing au) Jo Alfjenb [[essno auy3 saaoldwi uopelosd

siyt “aSewep pue aunisiow woJj sjepdiew Sulpjing u,,o uonoslo.d salnbay “uawaSeuel |BIIS1BIN UCIIINIISUCD 208

epsay1ag Jo

uopedaisuoy’

“WJ21 Suo] Y3 104 11 YHm S o3 1eyl sqof uasis

3y pue Jaue|d [nyIneaq siyl Aofua ued ualp(iyd s,usup|Iya J1eyl pue
USIp[iYyd JNo 0s ‘Ajjea0| 98ueyd S1ed Jo 83Ul jeqo)s ayl Suiresit
0] S9INQLIUO0D JBY] SIN1931IYIIE J[qeulelsns pue sai8alens Aouspiys
ASIauB Mau 10} SUOIIN|OS plog o} pasu 1Uain ay3 ssalppe o1 uolpe
|nySulueaw sapiaoad Ajn.y pue suonesiqo [e83] s,A3uno) ayj siouoy
1eY1 1RIp UOJ1RINSaY AAIINDEXT] MU B 31sanbad AjSuoals Agaisy am
-3WI] SWes 943 18 AWOUOI3 JNO PUE JUSWUOIAUS INo Yioq aaoldu
ues jeyy suondussald Aoljod ay1 pue s3180|0UYID) SYI BABY SM
-uo1IOBYSIIES JUBUSY J3YSIY pue sjuaJd saiadwod

210W ‘saseadu AJAonpoud Jels ‘uonuaial pue uopdeme
saAo|dws yons syjauaq 3|Wouods 3|qiSuel pue AIBACIBI 1503
Aouaiye ASI3UD J0) SMOJ|E SIYL "SISUMO WIS}-8uo] 8q 01 ue(d oym
siopjing Suioddns uo snooj Suo.3s B 3aey pinoys ST-TZ ¥3 payipow
v "404d juesiiusis e yum no 138 pue 3 dijy 4an11suod 03 SI3pfing
aAI1B|NJ3ds 3s0U} JOy JOISES 1 SYEL [|IM GT-TZ Y3 Yedp Jualind ayl
*MmO|3q paleIs

2Je Y2IYM JO SLOS S}Jauaq JIWouods AJefjloue 3]qen|eA JSY1o JO IS0y
e apinold pue sanjea Apadoud aseaoul ‘sqof usa.g [B20| 818810 51500
Sunesado pue 31n19nJIseLUl SSEIIIDP ‘SSEUBAINISAUI0D JIUIOU0ID
pue Aduapiys ASssua anoidw saifojouydal Sulp(ing 3|qeuleisns
:UOIINE JO SPIOM JIBY] YIlm 31jgnd JUSM U0[133104d [EIUBUILOIIAUT
10 Juswiedaq Y1 ‘peq oS S JJeup Sy "2jqedlideld JuSlxa Wnwixew
541 01 USIsaQ 28NS [LIUSILOIIAUT JuBWRldwWI 03 31epUBRW PuelAleln
10 51815 8y} pue Jwiad 191eMWI0IS p-SIN S AIUNoD 23 JO S|eos

ay3 Jayuiny 03 uiyiou Ajjeniia saop yedp ST-Tg H3 3y ‘Apejiwis
-1eaA-UO-1B9A sUOISSIWR pue asn AS1aua Buiseasdul |[13s ale am pue
‘S[9A3] S007 WoJ) Jussad 0T Aq SUOISSIWD HDHO oNpad 0} suonesijqo
193Ul 0} pajiey Aluno) aul JedA 1se “Alluewny jo [je 01 1ealy)
[BIIUBISIX® pue Juadin ue — aBueyd jeWI|D UO UOIIIe nySujueaw axe)y
01 Ayunyioddo 1se| Jno Sunsem Agaay} ‘S9AD3[e Joy Xipuadde ue

01 PaAGW 10 PO13[ap JOYUS Sk PalJelp se ST-TZ UONERNSaY AlINIDX]
ul sjuawalinbal Ayjigeulelsns 3J9| ZTOZ 8Y JO ISOW ‘SPUEIS 3 sy
*37D] 3y1 J0 sjuawBInbaul

Jewuiw ay1 jo AousBuLils 3Ul UlBIUIRW 0} $13119] nOA BUIpuas s

1ey3 Azsnpui Sulp|ing |e20| ay1 SpisBUC|e SISIAIIIE [RIUSWUOIIAUS Aq
paJeys si 18y} UIaoUC B — spiepuels Suipjing usais s,Ajuno) syl Joy
piemydeq dais e s1 uone|ndal siyi a1aym uiod sy o1 spuswialinbal
A31jIqBUIRISNS WNWIUIW JO SUI9SE] §,8P03 33 SuluEam

Aq Ayunyioddo anbiun sjy) s915em S321AIRS BuINIWIRd JO jusawnedag
3ay1 Aq paloyine se Yelp ST-Tg uonenday anindax3 ‘Appieunuiojun
*23u0 1e swajqold y1oq ssalppe AjnjSuluesw o} Aem [ewndo

ay1 s1 )DD1 ZTOT 243 os ‘uonn)jod J91EMULIO]S J0 32Jn0s 1533.e| 9|8uls




INON

10U $30P S| YdIYym JIAO Seale syl pue :o_uw_umt:_mm: wawedaq ayl yolym Jaao seale ayj SuiziuSodsd
apo9 siy1 1dope 03 Jueniodw i 1 18y} S92U88 pue gn[D ELISIS SY1 JO SIUBWLWO)D 3y} ssiepaldde Juawpedag syl

qnp
e1131S Ajuno)
Asauwio8juow
199UWWO)
JAIINIBXT
‘yiespuasiy
uesng

qnp
el1191s Ajuno)
AawoSuon
ey

‘sieas ane(q

apim Awuno) Sussealouy dois o1 uejd e Buipnpur{SoAd]
1eaA aseq Yl U IUNOWE BY3 MO[3q %08

01 SUOISS|WD sed asnoyusaad apim Ayuno) sonpas,
10} UB|d U0119910.d 91BWI) 3y SuidojaAap yum

1 pasieyd pue (9Ms) dnoug Sunjiom Alnqeutersns suy3
Paysi|qelss os|e [|ig YL "s|eod uopInpas OHO s, Aaunc)
343 PAYIPod YaIyMm ‘£0-Z€ [1ig pardope Ayuno) syl
‘8002 ‘zz |Mdy ‘“Aeq yiie3 uo ‘oSe sieah uanas Ajeau
‘wajqoad ay3 Jo ANlanas ayl Surziu8oday ‘Bulwiem
1eqoj8 10 s18)y3 1siom 3yl LaAe djsy o1 AjjerRueisqgns
pa3npad aq 1snw suoIssIWS (DHD) sed asnoyuasus 1eyl
S1 SNSUSSUO02 13dX3 |BUOIIRUISIUL SUIW[DYMIDAC Y1
punoJajoeg ‘spiepuels Ajljiqeureisns

Jadasp pue Japeolq uj }nsaJ salepdn IO

3Nn3n} JeY1 SINSUS 0} suonepuWWodl Xis Juisodoad
aJe os[e 9 “Altjiqeurelisns Supueyua pue 10329s
Suiping sy} ur s8utaes AS1oua Bulseasou) spJemol
uonaap 38 ayz ul days a8le| e o |IIm mou uonenSal
siy3 Surssed ‘quiod siy3 1e 3dope ued am Jeys piepuels
15ay81y ayp aq Jou Aew D9 pasodoud ay1 3jIym
s3953084d Bujuojssiwwod pssueyus ysnoiyl

S1I0443 UO[IBAIISUOD JO S4B BWIF-[R3] S RIS »
SIUBWIUOIIAUD

JOOPUI 3jqRHOIOD 3I0W PUB I3|Y][esY SPIACId o
ButppAdau pue asnau

[elI91eW U] 3SBaIoU] PUB 91SEM UOIINIISUOD 30NPaY
SUOISSILUD UOGJIED SINP3Y o

$1502 3IUBUSIUIEW

pue Sunesado pue asn AS1sua BUIp|INg 8INP3Y »
:spafoad Buipjing Ayuno)

104 S}J9USQ BUIMO]|0) DY) O] PE3] [|IM ‘SBP03 JO 31INS
Alojepuew e se D)9 3y3 jo uoidopy ‘syuswinedap
pue sapuage AJuno) ojul $33110e1d S[qRUIRISNS BI0W
21e1309]U] 0} [00] B SE DAIIS OS|E |[IM ) PUB JUSLdO|SASP
9jqeureisns 0} yseoidde pazipiepuels aiow e

ysijqeisa Alunod a3 djay [1m 3391 2Y) Jo uondope sy
'ST-Tz# uone|nday

aAnnaexg ul pasodoud se (DD91) 9poD uoiPNIISU0D
U93.5) |RUOIIBUISI| ZTOZ PIPUSLIE S92IAIBS Bumiwisd
340 Juswyedaq pasodoid ayi Jo uondope ay3 spoddns
‘sisquisw 0o0‘s AjP3ewxoldde jo diysiagquisw

e yum ‘dnoig gn[) eLRis Auno) AlswoSuo 2yl




A[9A119349 3Je SJUBWS.IINDaJ S8POI {U0IIONIISU0D

MaU [|e 10} 3seq 3Y3 SE Jauuew Ajsw e uj pajdope ale
sapod 8uipjing uaa.8 pue AS1sua snoloBL 1sow 3yl 18y}
2insus 03 ssado.d e dojaasp pnoys Axuno) ay) ‘udisap
Suip|ing uaa.8 pue Asuaplya-A813us Jo speuuld

Y3 Jussaidal A1uno) ay3 Ul pa1anaisuod sguipjing
103985 a1eAd pue ojqnd Mmau 1By} Insua o, :sapold
uejd U011I9101d 33BWID Y} JO £-)3] UCHEPUBWIWOIRY
*s|eo8 ddD 8U3 SaueApe 0] 13y3980] Siapjoyaels

pue sapuade A3y sy Buriq o1 Ajlunuoddo ue

s 51y} “Ajpueniodw) 210w pue spaepuels Ayjiqeuteisns
s, Aaunoj ay1 dn dwel o3 Ayunuoddo ue se

J09D] 3y} 995 am ‘s|eod ddD syl yum Suidasay Ul ‘Ayuno)
3Y1 W SUOISSIWS UogLes adnpal 01 paudisop swesdoud
a1j0woud pue Joddns 0] S| 5[OS UlRW N0 JO BUQ
Ajunos ays uj sweiSoud Ayjiqeuleisns

10 uoowoJd ay3 U] AR SJUSpPISaL pue ‘sdnoid

A1 ‘suoieidosse apeJs Sulp|ing ‘spauydUe ‘siadofaasp
‘sapuade Ajunod Aq pRHWIGNS SJUBWLIOI JO MIIABL
‘2107 D29 Jeuiuo 3yl Yum suosliedwiod ‘Sdd Ag
papuauwe se D39| 3Y3 40 seIp SUPLIOM JO malaal B3
‘sgurieay ayy pue syduosues) SuaaW XIS JO SM3lARI 3}
1UO SIUBWIWOD INo Sulseq ale 9 S31epdn pue SMalnsl
8J4n1n4 104 spusBWIACIdWw] Jo) suolssg3ns axew o) pue
2291 2y3 jo uondope ay3 Suiioddns yioq 4o uoruA
2Y1 Y1IM Sjuawwod o Suipiwgns ale app “dnoud
SupjJom yueg usa1D syl Uo saAllejuasaldal aney
Apuaiang am pue dnouBuom welido.d Supjewyousyg
|eRJSWIWOD 3Y1 Jo Juediled SAI10B UE 8Jam am pue
Aouapiye ASiaus Sunowoud swesSoid J3Yjo snouea
‘a)Isqam wod AlawosuoNUSIDAN 3Y3 JO UOIIBaL
Y3 se swelSoud yons uo AUno) syl YUMm paxJom aney
M ‘uolidope s3I 30UIS JUBWISSISSE PUE UoleuaWSdLLy
“uawdojaaap ‘uejd UOIIR3104d WD Aluno) 3yY)

Ul paAjoAul APADE USSQ SeY gqnpD eLI3IS ayL “38ueyd
12w SuIssalppe SIUSLWILISA0S [B20] JO JUOLDI0L

3y e sujewsaa AJuno) AIBWOoSuo 1eyl a1nsus

0} SeaJe Jo 98ues peoJq B SSOJIE SUOIIBPUIWWIOIRI
ayads g5 suleluod yatym ‘(ddd) ueld

u0[199101d a1ewWi|) ay) pardope Aluno) Asswogiuop
‘600Z Ul , 0S0Z YSnouyl sieadh g AJaAS LoJONPaL

9%0T B 9A3|yoe pue 0T0Z Ag Suoissiwa sed asnoyusaigd




40 950/ 91EUIWIS UED puk ‘Jalem djdelod SS3] %0 Se
YoNW Se 3sn ‘%EE Se Yonw se Ag SUOISSILUS ZOD d3npal
‘%06 01 dn Aq asn AS1aus 9onpaua ued sSulpjing usaJ3
1BU1 PRIUSWINIOP [[SM Sl 3| *PU 1Byl 0] SUBaW 3y}

s1 Suipjing usaJ8 puy ‘aJn1ny pIW 0] JB3U Sy 0JUL OS 3q
01 A[23]| S 40 3ANI3YY3 1502 A[JUSLINI S| JRY} SUOISSIWS
HHO SuINPal JO poyIawW Ajuo Y1 sl asn Adssus
Suip|ing Suljjo4uo) JUBWUOIIAUS 33 BuiSejueape

01 0s)e Inq ‘s3502 Bunerado Sulpjing Bupnpal

01 Ajuo Jou A3 s1 9sn ASssus Bulp|ing BuljjoJuc)

‘asn A3Jous [e30] JO %8P 01 dn Bunussasdas s3uip|tng
PUE SUOISSIWS SeDH 3SNOYUS3JD JO %0/ dWOS JO

334n0s 9y Sujaqg asn AB1aus Yum,, "10323s 3ulp|ing ay2
U) SUQISSIWD UOGLED JO UOIIONPAJ SYT 10} UOKHEAISSUQD
pue sSuines AS1aua azowodd 03 joo3 Alojepuewr

e se 11 Suisn 1oy |eipualod 3y st D)of eyl Sunndope

U} pa1saJalu] S| gnpD B.ISIS 3Y] 1ey] uoseal Jofew v
‘Ajuno)

AsswoSiuol uts3uip|ing 1oedw samo] ualyYa AS1aus
240w ‘Ja1yyesy Juileald Jo BI3 MAU B Yyoune| pjnod
$3p0od Mau sy "3|eas AJunol sy3 uo usisap Sujuueld
ueqJn a|geuielsns pue Sulpjing usais ul Jopeay Jofew

e aq pjnod Ayuno) AlawoSiuoN ‘Yans sy ") idope

0] $213UN0J Y30 Inds 03 Aem ay] pesj Ajpaignopun
pinom Supjerapun pjoq e yons Juiyl am Y 1dope

01 uoiieu 3y} ul AJunod 151y SY1 SW023g pInom Ajunod
AsawoSiuoW pue ‘DD syl pajdope pue papuswe
aAey BIqWIN|OD JO 1911151 SY) SB Yons suoldipsunf

|eI0] JoY30 1ey] 08y 3U) Aq padelnodus uaaq SABY IM
JapeaT |euolen

e 9q 0} Auna) AsswoBuol 1o Ayluniioddo uy
“sa210Yo AJBIUNJOA J0U PUE ‘S9P0I ‘Bjqeljlian
‘Alojepuew woJy paules aq pInom s3|nsal 9saY)

PUE UOJIESINL PUB|SI 1eaY PUE ‘UOISISAID UIeD1]S 31sem
‘SUDISSILB UogJea Supnpal ‘(o8e siesA §T paonisuod
s8uip|ing ueyl JAMO] %0S) uolanpaJ Adssus ydnoldyy
dd? 3y3 jo s[eos ayi 01 Jasod sh s3uLIq 0s|e DD

ay] -Ayjiqeureisns ajowoud Jeyl sapod pazipiepuels

40 JUSWadI05US puE uonedljdde wuojiun pue

ysnouys ‘aseq 1ey} ssysi|qelss DD YL |, wiojiun pue
ySnoJoyl ‘aA1193443 S| JUBWIRDI0JUR 1BY} pUe s19feuew
Bulp|ing pue ‘siadojaAdp ‘S19p|INg 03 PlRUIBSSIP




-oIWou0d3/uojuldo/wed smausnmmm//:dny -

L« Anjesnau azewnp

10 [208 s)1 pJemOl DAN SujACW 10U S| UONIEIYIUISD
Buipjing @331, 18Ul PS1sa83ns pjalods uyor J0ssajoid
a8aj00) uIIRqO Ag JeaA 15| pa1dnpuod saiadold

J0A MBN J0 ApNis y "[aqe] PR1dA0d 8Y1 01 dn SUlAl| Jou,
2JaMm 1By SN1BIS 0337 YUMm $3un3ona3s uo Jupodal sem
sawly] JJOA M3N 3L ‘600T S doeq Jej sy “Suisnuold
Ajwaojun woly ey usag sey siaAedxe) 10} WON0 aY)
pue ‘sasodind upaia-xe] Jo A1o1e|n3aJ Joj S9pod JI3Y}
01Ul @331 USNHM dARY SaJlljedDIUNW PaIpuUny {BISASS
‘ejqWN|o J0 10L13SIA Y1 S2PISag,, ‘Pajou Loday pUOM
pue sMap "S'N Ul 3pIMe 107 ABN & W) palodal sy
ap02 AS.1aus STOZ dY2 199W UIABS J0U Op Su3walinbas
Al0jepUBW { UOISIBA 0331 dY1 ‘@pod ASssud

STOT Y3 jo uondope 3y} Yum 1ey) ‘paou aq pjnoys

1 ‘UOLIIPPE U] "PazI[eal 3 10U ||IM ‘UCIIEDYILISD SU3 YIm
pa30adxa a1am 1ey) spiepuels Altjiqeureisns ui sugesd sty
‘patdnano ale Asyl sauo ‘as0jelay) ‘(paidnado 1 uale
Aayi “a°1) Butpjing |[3ys pue 2103 e 34e panosdde usaq
aney jeys spafosd @337 2yl JO SWOS ‘JeYl palou 3q
p|noys os|e 3 "Aluno) ay3 ui s3afoad 3ulpjing jo aleys
15931 9y} 2un3ded 01 1934 a1enbs 000‘S 1R PaYs!|qelIsd
uaaq Sey apo3 3y} pue ‘suoiuppe Suipfing Ajiwey-lfnw
pUE [BI0JAWILIO M3U PUE UO[IDNIISUOD AJlle)jnl pue
|e1oJaWWod mau T1y 03 Aldde [jim 299] 8y ‘uosiedwod
u| "saAl323[qo |euoiielldse JO NUSW B WOJy papieme die
sjujod @337 pue WalsAs ujiel [9AS]-Z € UO [9A3] 15aMO]|
23 JO paiiad 4331 2G 01 ‘[B|2J3WWOD PUB SSIH01S
 J9A0 AjjweMjnw 400} a1enbs 000 0T J9A0 Buip(ing
paJan0a palinbas g-g UONas ‘sdulpling zyT o3 paldde
usaq Ajuo sey meT Bulpjing U35 Y3 800 NUIS
‘Buines A81sus

10 ddURUIIUIEW puR SupolUOW ‘su01Rdsul 93S-UO o}
sjuawalinbal apnjaul YaIym ‘79| 343 Se |ans ‘Sepod
Alojepuew jo auns e Suiysiqelss Aq Jeq Aujiqeuteisns
33 OS]4 0} P31RAID UDI] SARY SPJEPUR]S JOYI0 ‘SIedh
M@y 1sed ayz ui ‘saanpeld uip|ing Jeusasd Suipuedxs
10} UoIlEPUNOG] [BIHU] DWOS PapiAcld sey a337 UM
*syoafoad Suip|ing ajqeulelsns 1o2)as 01 siadofaasp

104 $3310UD JO NUSW € Sey Yolym pIepuels ay3 se 8007
ui 331 Sunndope Aq ‘Bulpjing uaaJ8 sjowoud 03 suoys
Jolew awos apew Apealje sey AJuno) ayl , 91Sem pijos




PUE UOIIEAISSUOD WNWIUILW 335 |IM JIDD] Y1 3)IYM
‘9|qe|leA. 34 []13S ||IM UOHEIILII GIIT YHM palejdosse
SSAILUIIUI XB] JBY) PRIOU 3q PINoYs Y ‘Os|y "papusLue
se 75| 3y yum asuel|duiod Jo [aAs| Jus[eAlnb3

Ue 1SE3| 38 MOYS ISN pue ss3304d UOIIRIYIPOIA 3P0
ano y3nouy: apew a4 |jeys yied aoue)duwod salzeUIS) e
ue 10§ s1sanbsy jjam se pansind a( 03 pamojje

39 OS]e |{Im S3gOo[H UIIJD JO UOJIINIISUO) U3BIDH
3s11dJa1ug Se Yyans SIAIELIDYY {"SIUSWUOIIAUD J00pUl
10 S3UBUSIUIBW pUe USISSP 3y} 404 SPIRPURIS JYHHSY
+000¥ s9ysiqnd IvyHSY) ©2291 2yt Aq paplaoid

yied aoueydwod |euofido Jayioue s| piepuels T°68T
(3vyHSY) sseauldug Su uo2 Jiy pue Sunessdiey
‘Sunesy jo A391P0S uedBWY 3YJ "SBUIP(ING BSN-PaxiwW
30 suoyuod jeuapisay ayl Suipnppui ‘00L-DD1 3sn Aew
199} a.enbs 0OO‘S J9A0 -y pue z-Y sdnouo ‘s|dwexa
10y ‘[|aMm se s13pj|ing JoJ syled soue|jduiod aAjeusslje
se ujewal [jim suoizdo Jayjo pue uondo ,8pod

anoqe,, Ue aq Ued g331 DI9] Jo Uodope 8yl Yim UsAg
-sapuade Auno) ol sadndesd

3|qeUlelSNS 3JowW 91e4Ss1ul 01 [00] B SB 2AISS Osje

ued 1 Jey} pue JuswdolaAap s]qeulelsns pazipiepuels
aJow ys|[ge1sa Awunod syl djay ||im HD9)| 8yl

Jo uondope ay1 Uyl apn "12 sBulp|ing SOUBWIOHSd
ySiH puejAJe|N 3} 198 01 JIPIO U} UOIBIYIHIS) pue
aoueldwo) JOAJIS @3FT YUM P31eId0SSE $1S0D 80Nnp3ald
01 sueaw e s] DO 18y} PapN|dUod uaAs 1oday |1punc)
Supying uaa.o pueilueiy £T0Z v (9 "3d ‘Amsda)
~due|d apeid anoqe $91401s ¥ JaNo (3.e) 5] 1)
s8uiping [epuapisal p-y pue z-Y Suipnpuy ‘Butpiing
[B1IUapISaJ A[lWE-I}NW JO [elluBpIsa-uou BunsIxa

Ue 01 SUOIIppE Jo PaaNIISUod Ajmau Aue o} saldde,,
ap02 A[13A0 A101BPUBW B SE “))D) 't UOISIOA 033740
UOISIBA 159M3U 3L} UIA3 uey) Soueuliopiad Jo sulaseq
1ay3iy e sapiaoad 1 1Yl S1 D)9 Yl Jo uondope

03 a8ejuenpe Uy Jpd-maIASAQDIDIZTOZ/Ipd/sd
p/n08-pwAlunosfiawodiuow sadiaiassuniiwiad// dny
. Aljenb fejuawuoliAu Joopul

pue Jie ‘19jem ‘ASIauD ‘S[elI9IBW ‘S324N0S3) [BINjeU JO
UOI1BAISSUO) PISSIIPPE 3 “JUSWUOIIAUD |BINJRU 3Y] UO
UBWUOLIAUS }[Ing 9y} o s1oedwi aanedau syl 2anpald
0} papualyl SI,, ‘Bp0J ,SUI|SSEQ,, |SPOW B SB ‘)9 3Y])
siahedxe}-s1s02-pue-snjea
-PPE-1US30P-UOIRRIYILSI-PR/80/S0/¥TOT/2IUBI|[2Iu1




‘S3A1393[3 193[0.1d DY1 0IUI PSAOL 10 PIISIDP JoUYND
ua3q aABY 3POd JDD Y1 JO SUOIIBS BY] 4O Jaquinu

e 1ey 108} 343} IN0ge pasied uasq SABY SUI32U0D

1ey3} 38pajmouIe 01 ji| pINom 3 jpd-sapodal
Suiusa.n/ypd/sajy/inesap/saus/aio yueremmm//:diy
L HIng aq Ajjeanjeu ued

Aem ay1 aaed o3 sBuipjing djgnd 10} SIUSWIILIWOD pue
diystapes] Ae[dwaxa 10§ SOAIIUDIUI YIIUM JO Bul[Sseq
MBU 3jgBIA B 3JE S9P0D 953U 1 "AJlUNWIWIOD BJius

ayz Joy 100y 3y} Suisies sof Sujuueld Aljiqeuieisns

40 Heay 3y} e 96 S9P0J djgisuodsal Aj[2IUdIUCIIAU
210W PUE ‘I3jYy}{edy ‘J94es "sapod Sulpling

U238 Aloyepuew ‘BAlsuayaIdwiod alow ‘133uoLls

ynm diysiapesj siy1 Jusws|dwod o3 Juenodw

Ajlenba s1 11 ‘wnwiuiw 3y pucAsq o3 03 pusiul

1ey3 s8urpjing Joy diyssapes| apo3-puoiaq 1ewyousq
03 pausisap uaaq aney @331 Se yans swaisis

Suped Suipjing usaJd 3|1y :100[d S} Suisiey :19pisuUod
Mou Aew suordIpsun( ‘gof ayj 4oy 5003 Jo 13 Wsu

3yl YUM “uswisAow Sulp|ing uaa.s sy} Jo ylew|[ey

B 3W003( aAeY jey) suojieaouu] Adjjod sy3 Jsyuny

03 pJey ssa.id osje pue ‘suopdo Adfjod Sulp|ing usa.3
9|qE[I_AE JO ISIIAIUN Y] JOPISU0D pinoys Sutuued
Aypigeureisns uy page8ua uonaipsunl Auy -padxs
Ajgeuoseal ued am Jsow aYy3 uey) Jayied ‘op Ajqissod
ueD aM 1594 3U1 S8 U2as 3q AW SSPOI 359U] ‘SWDISAS
Sunes apos-puohkaq Jo asn ayi Sujqeus pue Suijowo.d
noyum ing ‘sapiroad uaai3 Fuip)ing 1eys s1ysuaq
aniyisod ay3 Aq payonoun uiews. suipjing jo Aylofew
3Y1 ‘s3poo Auojepuews aalsuayasadwod siow Ussuons
1noyum "sjoo} Suiaiip-1axJew |[nd pue ysnd Jo olRUSIS
2s5e2-)53q 9y anotd walsAs Sunel Suip|ing uaaud
apo2-puoiaq e pue apod Buip|ing usa.d e ‘Aem 113y} uo
|IoMm aJe oym dsoy Joj osfe pue ‘Bujuueid AJjiqeurelsns
uo Supjiequia suonoipsun{ jo jaquinu agie|

ayj 4o, :3d189xa s1yy 13d se ‘sopod Buipjing u2a.3 Joy
woddns pajels ‘909; 9y} Jo uswdojaasp sy} ul papie
Yaiym ‘|ouno) Suipjing usalo sa1els paluNn ayl TT0Z
Aely se >oeq Jej se ‘3391 a3 Jo sadse ulensd noge
SUJFIU0D ALOS Passaldxa aaey Auunwiwed Suipjing
31 JO 5101935 SNOLIBA B[IYM “SIUSLWANbal wnwiulw
3y1 anoge 08 031 s12dojaASp S8eIN0IUS 01 BNURUOD [(IM
S3AIIU3IUY BY) pue siseq AJejun|oA e uo pansind ag ||us
UED UOIIRIIILI90 @337 ‘Bpo2 se spiepuels Alljigeuleisns




uienad 1ey} JJ9] 40 SUDIIISS SP0d BY1 ‘@pod Suipjing Aq
paie(n8aJ 10U aJe suois3P asn pue| 1ey) Asljod Ajuno)
s] 11 22uls ‘sue|d J23SEW PUE 31IS ‘MET UOHBAIISUOD
153104 §,A3uno) ay} ‘ssoueuIpIQ SutuozZ o} 3[qisuodsal
s1 DddDON-IN ‘@jdwiexa 1oy} ‘@jiym ‘soueldwod

pue sapo3 1oy 3[qIsuodsal S| Sdd "JUBWUISAOD

[elopad 3y} PUB ‘JuswiuoJIAUg BY3 O JuawLedag
puejAiiN ‘DddIN- “ISSM Se yans sslauade

19410 j0 AjJoyine 3yl Japun |je} 1eyl sapljod pue
sjuawalinbal ‘spiepuels ‘sme| Bulisixe ay3 03 S9P0I
Japow,, 393] 8yl Suliedwod JO Ynsal B Se ‘SIAINIDD

0] PAAOLW 10 P3]3[SP S13M 3P0J 3Y) JO SUOILIS

UjeLIa) "1V J131BM UESD [RIDP3H Y3 YUM 1IIJU0d

183 SBP0J pue (DddIN-A) uolssiwwo) Suluueld

pue yled jeude] jeuotieN puejliely yum deliaro

1BY31 S3P02 3y} SB YoNs ‘|0J31U0D S]] PISING 4. ey}
seale U310 199)Je 1Y) S3po2 jo uondope sy asodoid
jouued sdq st se, paidope ag 03 JuedSW j0u e Aay]
pUE SUOIIEN}S 91E)S ‘AND ‘A1UN0D BY3 114 0} pauipowW pue
pamajAal 9q 03 JUESW SIB 1BY} SpIepuels apad 3ulping
|opow siayo JI9| 8yl 1eYl PUBISIIPUN O] [BIIUISSD

st 1] *(DSSM SU1 JO 3sed a3 ul Se Yons) sapijod uans

pue ‘suonie|n8aJ ‘sme| ‘(919 ‘SBuiuoz pue 3uip(ing) sepod
IUS.IND 3Y3 Yim 1edwiod pue mainal 01 Suidusjjeyd
s,}1 pue ,apod Aelano [9pow,, B sI | 3snedsaq pue Suo s
13pPISU0) 01 S3P0J JO 11| 3y} asnedsq Hed uf s;1ey] pue
‘umop Jo dn ‘apIap 03 uno) AWNOD) SYL 310§3G MOU
5,31 2Jaym jutod ay1 01799 2yl 198 01 54e3A ¢ UBRL 5,1
4pd:maintanQd0nizToz/4pd/sd
p/A0S:pwAlunoaAsewosiuow-sadinssSunuad//:duy
.~ W31sAs Sujie Alejun|oA e yum

9]q1ssod 10U S11J8UB( [2IUSWUOIIAUD SAISSEW 3ARIYIE
0}999] ay1 Suluoisod-s8upping |je o} Alljigeurelsns
40 JOO|} BY1 SasIe1 D)9 Y2 ‘siseq Alolepuew e

uo pajdope aleym ‘suopdope Alojepuelws o} ainn 0}
a00p 3y} uado ued suopdope Atejunjop,, 1Byl 51 JJ9)|
10 yoeoudde iseq 8yl "SIIUBUIPIO JO SOPOI |qedy|dde
JBU10 Japun Sjuswalinbal [BJUSWUONAUS 10 Yijeay
‘Ayajes apasiadns 40 98pliqe 01 papuajul Jou osje

S§1] "3UWNO0P UojIe|NSaJ UOIINIISUOD ,SUO|EPUBIS,,

e Se pasn aq 03 Papusu! J0U s] 1l Pue uoAIPSLN] 3y
Ag splepuels pue sapod Jay10 yum uolpunfuod ul pasn
2 0] papusalu| s1 } ‘Yons Se pue ,3pod Ae[I3A0,, UE S|
J79| 3yt 1843 pueISIBpUN 0} Jueriodu 1 Y Y xipuaddy




191504 pue 83UBYUI UBD YIIYM JO ||e ‘sa|Bojouyday uaaug
MBU JO 2sn pue Juawdo[aasp sy} ands ues A3y} pue
‘Butuue|d ueqan ‘Auysnpui Bulp|ing a3 Ul SiusWAA0Id W]
01 pesj Ajjenjoe ues Asyl ‘awod1aA0 aq Ajuo jou

ued ‘asod D)o ayr saBuajjeyd sy “pasodoid se )79
3y 3uizdope pusWWIa. 3.10)2.J9Y1 9Mm pue spafoid
104 yum BuiAidwiod o1 pawolsnode st Alizsnpul Suipjing
3Y1 YAYM ‘T°68T IVYHSY 3pn[aul saop ‘pascdosd

SE DJ9| 9Y1 ‘Y puelsiepun am se ‘1snamoy ‘porad
LUI-eseyd,, e 10} pajjes aney SIUILWWOD SWOS ey}
pueistapun apn “swi] Suissasoid pspusixs Joy sledasd
pue ‘s23} |euonippe gJosqe Ajgissod ‘spsfoid jo

awin udIsap 8y} Ul saseB.IOU| U] JoJoeY ‘s3ojouyIa] MBU
3OS uJea| ‘apol a3yl yum Ajueljwey 219y3 dn dwes

:01 sejued assy1 aanbal jim D91 aY1 0S ‘spaepuels
JVHHSY Pue G337 YUM Jeljiwe) S.e s[euolssagosd
usisap 1ey3 108} 8y} ‘se yans ‘Ajuno) ay3 01 asod 7o)
a1 dundope jey; sadua||eyd ayz Jo awos a8pajmow}de
0s[e apn *9aue|dwod U] 3q 01 paWaap aq [jim

1 splepuels wnuwiuiw paanbal ayy puoAaq o8 seandsie
129f0ad Uasoyd Jjay) seleisuowap 1afoud e se Suof sy
24 000°0¢ @noqe s1afoid 1oy~ pue ‘7Y 000°0Z-000°0T
uaamiaq s1eafosd 10)-¢ ‘Z1 000°0T 01 dn spafoid

104-7 {S3A1193|3 t-g usamiaq Buiinbal Suisodoid

a.e A3yl pue ‘paniugns suswwod olgnd uodn

paseq sjuawalinba. ay3 paisnipe sey sdq “9Io1 a3y

10 UOISIaA |BUY BY] 1O} ‘SBAIIBID 7 paJinbal Ajuo 139
3Y31 Jo uojsiaa pasodoud 151 3431 3IYM *saduaBe sayio
9s3y1 Aq 135 SjuaWLINbal pue spiepuels WnwiuW ay}
an0ge 03 UdIym SIAND[F 199[0Jd 01 POAOLL U] BARY
SUOI123Ss ‘DA0QE PaloU SIUIRIISUOD JYT D}BPOWILLOIIR
01 "$3p02 JDJ9| mau Jo uonndope pue MmalAal o sseooid
3y3 ul (alow pue ‘snoqe paisii asoyl “5-3) Anjiqeulelsns
Suinoaduyy Uy 3ye3S B 3ARY OyMm saiuied sy} (je

a8e8ua 01 Ajunyioddo ue se 19| 8y3 Jo saepdn aininy
3sn pinoys s4q ‘pazdope si JD91 3Y3 UQ ‘SpPIBPUE]S
A1l[tgeulelsns Ayuno) Suisier Jo Juul BYI YUm

8po2 Do) 3yl Sundope s1apisuod Aaus pue Aduade
yaes J2y3 0S S3IP0I Y} JO MDIASL PUB UCIIRUIPIO0I
Wwawyedap/Acuade-1ajul yBnolyy passaippe

3 p[Noys syl auniny 3yl uj "saPOI [Bpow JJot

3Y)1 Burpa3axa 1o Sunasw s} AAunae) 3yl 18y} ainsua

01 ‘pasedwios pue pamaiaal Aj|n) pue passaippe aq

01 paau pjnom DddIN-W Ag palejn8al aJe jey) asoy) 03




INON

‘uejd JuswaSeuew a1sem IS w:_u__:n B 9]3]8p 0} UOIIBPUSWIWIOI3. 3} Y}Im 33.15e j0U Op 3

, *sjuawalinbas wnwiuw

a1 anoqe 08 0} ssodojoaap a8eInoduL 03 SNUIUOD SBAIIUIDUI BY3 pue siseq Aieaunjoa e uo pansind aq |]13S ued
UOIIEDID g3 ‘OPO2 SE SpIepuels AJljigeuleIsns pue :,o:m?_mm:Ou WINWEUIW 135 {[IM 33D 3Y3 3|IUM "3|gE|IBAE 34 [jI3S
|[IM UOREIYILIDI @ITT YHM PBIBIDOSSE SBAIJUSIU] XB | “Papuswe se JJD| 8yl YUm 3auelduwlod Jo [9A3] Jus|eatnba ue 1ses)|

1B MOYS ISNW pue s5320.d UOIIEIIHIPOIA 3P0 JNo YSnolyl %umE 34 Jjeys yied aouel|dwod aAlleUIB){E UE JO) S}SBNbaY “[]am
se pansind aq ued SIBY}0 JO S3G0|9 UIdID ‘UOIIINIISUOD _._mm,:w aspIdlaiug ‘g7 Se YIns SaARBUIS)|Y "PapUSWIE SB )5 ay1
yum Adusjeainba Suinoud Aq peaoldde aq ‘sssooad UoieaIPOIAl BP0 9y YSnouyl ‘ued T°68T AVHHSY Yyim aaueljdwod |iny
ansand 03 Sutysim jou 123foad Auy 329 sy3 Aq papiroid &mn 3sueldwos [euondo JayI0UE S| pIepuels T'68T IVHHSY Syl
*sjuawaJinbal

9po) ASJsu3 ST DY 199W 10U SIOP A (331 |USAT "op 01 334 3AeYy Alunod 8y} ul syafold payiHss 337 Isow

BulyBWos si Sly] *dPo3 wnwiuiw Y3 yim asuerdwod m>o¢n 03 paau sAemuied aouejdwod 3ARUIBHE ‘ABQ BY] 39S DO
3y, *,wieioid 3po) 9A0qy,, AIBIUN[OA B 1N 3PO3J B Jou §] 337 "Suljaseq mau e Buinas se uoiidope J)o| ay) Jo 1oddns

uj AJjny 3uswajels aljgnd e apew Jg9sn TTOZ Ul *299SN %T:E:_ 3U3 YHM JUS1S[SUOD S| Jey} JSUUBLW B uj sujaseq Sulp[ing
u3a.8 Auejdwsxa ue Suiss aq paspul |[m AJunod 3yl 3391 3yl yum Ajdwod o3 1918348 10 4S 000°S S13foad Buunbai Ag
‘uone|n8al syl Aq paloaye usaq 10U saey Ajunod mrp ur so8foud 350w pjoysaiyl §s 000‘0T dY} JO asnedaq ‘spafoid

LT Ajuo 03 paydde sey uolrediied aIa Eo%vcm,E 03 saj[dde 3| se meq Suipjing usa19 oyl SpeI3P B AjIEdU JoUY
-sgulpping paiiaa-uou yum Jed uo wiopad suip|ing papiya
@337 ‘wed 1sow sy JoJ 1BY1 MOYS D9SN Jo awoy ayi g uoiduiysesn Suipnjoul Alaunod ay: anoy3nolyl palonpuod
S3IPNIS “suodIpsUN{ Suipunollns sy} woiy EE&EU Ajjenuelsgns s| Hg uojdutysepn Ul Juswuoaua Sulpjing 2yl

uojSulysem
ueyjodosiapy

pue wuawuedy
‘yaoy

93sem ais Suipying e Supuawe|dwi pue Suido[oAdp 10) JusWAIINbaL
3yl PSIS[EP BIqWIN|OD JO DUISIA dY1 ‘AjgRION ‘S[|IJPUBR| JNO wox
paiiaAip pue papAdal Suaq aJe 1ey) s|elslewW J1199ds SY3 UO pea)sul
snooy pue uejd juswaSeuew disem a)s Suipjing e 1o} usWAIINbAL
ayr ayMIs pnoys Aunoy 9yl ‘NOILVANTIAWOIIY vaov
[13A31 3ZNOYE] "plepuels

00£ D21 9Y1 o uonesijdde uo SJUBSWWOI 5,¥gOY 199Yal 03 ‘Smoj|o) se
1T a8ed ‘T°Z0€ 9[qeL uf 98en3ue| 3siAdY :NOLLVANININOIIY VIOV
[¥3A71S 40 AvalsNI

T3A3T 3ZNOYE] "Mo]aq parou se 3po) UOIIINIISUOD USSID I ETOT UL
Ul ud)el uolde o3 Jejjwis Yied soue)dwiod aAlIRUIR) R PIZIIOYINE ue
S1 00 221 18y Ayle]o JayLing 03 puawy :NOILYANIWINOIIY VOV
‘BIGWIN|OY) 0 12U1SIa

QU3 Ul p|oYSs3Iy JB[IWIS B YUM JUBISISUCD 8¢ pjnom sIyl ‘T'Z0E 3[qeL
01 |[3A3| ®zU04q dY} 18 00L D] 01 9duaJaial e Suippe syoddns yaov
'NOILYANIWIN0IIY VAoV

"BIQUIN|OY JO PIISIq 3y Ul pardope s8enSuej o1 Jejiwis

pIoysaiyl 183} ‘bs QOO'OT UlRIUIRIA NOILVANIAWINOIIY vaov

suoIpIpsin{ [e30] 3y} Suowe Aoud)sisuod
uleluiew o] :3djeuoniey ‘|Ppow Suipjing udaip 3Q@ uoiSuiysem
adopy  (AYYWINNS) :NOLLVANAINIWOIIY vaoy odods Z'ToT

[s1uawwod Jy3 wouy 3diandg] ‘sdq ueyl

1330 susuliedap Jo sapuade jo Ayjiqisuodsas ayj 1o
aA11ea1[dNpP 3Jam 1BY] SBPOD Jam A3Lj3 asnedsq paaow
10 pa33|ap 3J3M SUO[1IBSANS 3Y} JO AuBW ‘BAOQE pajou
sy "pasodotd Ajjualind se 3)91 papuawe ayl Suiidope
u Ae[ap e jo asnes 3y3 Jou aJe A3Y3 1843 34NS Iew pue
sanbd 3SaYY MaIASL Aj|nyaJed 01 [(DUNCD BY) UoiIned
@M ‘pa1dope sl 11 suojaq ,pausayidualis, aq o1 spasu
2J404243U3 U 1BY1 puB ,‘P31In3, SEM 3pO2 3] 1Byl pue
JI91 3y} ,udeam, AjA110219 sjUSWIpUSWE 3SSU3 1Ry}
swile|d aJe aJsyL 'y xipuaddy ‘©A1193]2 2yl 01 pasow
pue pa13|9p UI3q dAeY 1By} SUOIP3sgNS 3yl Bujpiesal
uJa3U03 J18Y) paJa3sIdal aaey suofieziuesio pue
SJUBPISSJ SWOS 1y} 99pajmoudde op am ‘Ajleuid "II9|
2y} paydope aAey s1owlljeg PUB BIqWNjOD JO 1911sIQ
ay3 se quawdojanep pue Suiuuejd a|qeuleIsns SPIEMO}
pus.) [eUoIBaY 343 YUM JUS1SISUOD OS[e SI IO 84} Jo
uondopy “Awuno) AsawoBiuo uj Awouods usais ayy




*]UaWa21oud pue uonedljdde wiofiun pue ySnoioyl faAII3YS S9|(eus pue 3seq 1.yl SaYSI[qeIsa JJD| YL ,wiojun

pue y3no.Joy} ‘@AIIIBYS S JUSWIDIOS 1ey] pue ‘siadeueiu Buip|ing pue ‘siadojanap ‘SISpJiNg 01 P1BUIWASSIP AjPAINIRYD
24 sjuatuanbal S3POD {UOIFINIISUOD M3U |[B JOJ BSEQ B SE JauuewW AW B U paidope a.1e sopod Suip|ing usaJ8 pue
AS15U2 shoJoS1 150w 3y} 18Y] 31nsu? 0} ssaoo.d e dojaaap pinoys Aiuno) 3y ‘udisap Bulp(ing uaais pue Aouslya-AZIsus
Jo apeuuld ayy uasaidss Auno) 3y Ul paloNIISUo m%:_u__:n 101095 a3eaud pue a1jgnd mau eyl 31nsus o], :sapiaold
uejd Uo1193104d SIRWILD 3Y} 4O $-)TF UOIIEPUSWIWOIIY ISUCIIONPAI [BIUSWJIUI YUIM 0S0Z Ag SUOIssIwS sed asnoyusaid

U] UoIIdINPaI %08 Uk S0} S|[ed ‘s8uyl 1810 Suowe ‘ueld cﬂo:uwuo_n_ 31BWI|D 6007 Auno) AISWOBIUOA 3y "SUOISSIWS sed
asnoyuaals uo Pedw Juedsyiusis e aney sSuip|ing "ss3Ippe 01 18y1980] dJom 1snw am 1eyy wisjqo.d {eas Aisa e st Sujwiem
1eqo}D "SUOISIIA STOZ 3Y1 01 S9p03 Bulp|ing 18y} Sunepdn L_o sa8els AlJea ayy ut sl D uolBulyse 1Yl puelsispun osje 3\

"MO3Q palou se [SLNINIUINDIY

AVMHLYd Q313AON] 209 9siAeY :NOLLVANIWINODIY VvEOV
‘Bupe|ap poddns

[3LIS NO SONIATING F1dILTNN §°T09] :NOLLYANIWINODIIY vEaov
v Xipuaddy 03

11 2A0UI pUB UOIP3S 1By} 819|3p 01 jesodoid Ajuno) 18al 01 OT9 03
2IUa19421 BYUIS "SUOIIIAS IsaL a19jep 01 Suisodoud s Ajuno) sy se
609 PuUB 9°809 U0I}IaS 03 30UIJ3J AMIS :NOILVANIWINOIIY VIOV
'V Xipuaddy

01 Bumow poddns [SdiNVT 90S] :NOILYANIWINOIIY vaOV
'y xipuaddy 01 Suinow

voddns [NOILDIT3S IVIHILYIN S0S] :NOILYANIWINODIY VA0V
‘8upajep voddns [DNITDADIY

anvy INIWIDYNVIA JLSYM 0S] :NOLLVANIWINODIY VEOV
-ueyd

0] 9UBIaJR $919|2P YoIum T'E05§ G 193deyD) 151 Od £10¢ 1dope pue
uejd Juswoageuey 31SEM PUE [BLSIBIA UOINIISUC) B Sunnuawa|du)
pue Suidojansp Joj juawalinbar syi 9190 [INIWIDVNVIA
JISYM NOIDNYISNOD €0S] :NOILVANIFWINOIIY VEOV
"[s3ovuns

400¥] -€'80r 8unsiep woddns NOILVANIWNODIY Va0V
¥ xipuaddy 03

anow poddns [3IdvISAYYH LIS Z°80¥] :NOILVANININOIIY VEOV
'y xipuaddy o3 anowt poddng

[LOVdIAI | NOLLYLHOdSNVYL Z0b] :NOLLYANININOIIY VvEov
“papiaoad

3q [{eys UOISIBAIP J0 33U3PIAS ‘Ipjaiffo apod ayy Aq paisenbal uaym
‘UOIIINIISUOT JO 3SIN02 3Y1 YSnouy) pauleiuiew aq |[eys

UOISIDAIP 0} Pa3e|aJl UO1IeIUSWNIop JOY1o J0 s1dI8ady '

*s9|nJ aupueenb syl yum Ajdwoo jjeus JuswsSeuew

uone}adan a1is Suip|ing ‘s3193ds 309su] SAISEAU] 10) BUOZ dunuelenb
pa1eusisap 93]S JO |BISPSY B Ul PB1BIO] S| 3US SY3 SJBYM T

*sapaads jupjd aaISDAUY JO {BSOMSIP pUe LONINIISIP DA BYL T
:sjuawasinbau

jeuoiippe  Sumojjo} 9yl yum Aldwod jeys uswdopasp
ous Suipjing 9yl -uoneidsSsa paleposse pue sdwnis  ‘ssal)
204 sapnul sugap Sules|d-pue] “S||JPUB] WOy PIUSAIP 3] [BYS
a1is Suip|ing e woly sugap Sulesjdo-puel 3yl Jo Juadsad g7 Uyl SS9
10N “sjuswainbaa
woawafeuew asem aus 3uiping T90r § JI291 JA €T02
‘suopIpsunf ajdiynw ul Sunesado sisumo Ayadosd

350y} 10} UoiSaJ Sy} Ul sJUSWAJINbal Je[iuls saey o3 jueniodwi S
*2p03 [2poW 3Y3 JO Z'90F PUB T'90%§ popuswe pue ue|d Juswadeuew




"y xipuaddy 01 Suinow poddns [IUNLINYISYHINI

3ISNOdSIY ANVIANIA AILVINOLNY $09] :NOILVANIWINODTY VEOVY
*s8up|ing payiuas-Jels ABIsug Jo 15| a|qe[ienae

-Apijgnd ‘sjqeyatess e suleluleW Y43 ‘Af|eucilippy "snieis Jisyl Jo
2ouapIAR se anbejd e aaey [|Im ‘ajdwexs 1oy ‘payiad Jels ASsug e
1ey3 sSuipjing 1ey3 ‘003 910N "paysijdwode Sujaq ApeaJje s ajgnd
uojdwnsuod Agsaua Suipjing Supjew jo jeod Asjjod 21ignd ay3 ‘yons
Sy "9T0g ‘aunf ul elep Supjiewydsusq Suntodal wdaq jum s3uipjing
91eAlld "V XIpuaddy 0} anow ‘AjaAlleuIB)|Y "8J4INbad 0] SNOJBUO 00}
S111 se [AV1dSId AD¥INT] 9°€09 319[2A :NOILLYANINWOIIY vaov
‘sjuawa.inbal Suriodad

200 341 313 01 UOIIEPUSWILIOIDL DY} YILM JUSISISUOD SI T°§E09
SupjLIS "9'E09 19[S 01 UCNIBPUSLLWOIDI 93 :djeuoney "1°S €09
a19[ep pue [NOILVDIHIA ANV LNIWIHNSYIN ADYINT INNININIALI
S°€09 Ul §°£09 01 32UDI942. 813134 ‘NOLLVANININOIIY VIOV

*3P0) Uo19NISU0) usaio e Sundope Jo

|e08 s} aAsIyoe Ajuno) ay3 djay ||1Is |[Im pue d11s)jeau 3J0W S1 s3ulp|ing
1281e] yum Suipels pue ys|jdwaeade 01 A1 NDILIP PUe 1509 8Y1 $95ea.10U]
2z|s Sulpjing Jajjews v "s1oafold Iajjews SuluapInganc YUm sulaauod
ssauppe 03 'Y "bs Q00‘00T 01 PjoYsaJyl WNwIUI 3yl ssiel p[hoys
Auno) ay3 ‘Appalleulaly  “spafosd |[ews 03 uaping Ay} uo paseq
T'¥"€09 pasodoud Supjuls SpUsWIIOIRI ygOY :9jeuoiiey [ONIYILIN
-8NS 3dAL AYO1 ADYINE] "7'€09 IS :NOILYANIWINOIIY Va0V
‘Auno)

3} Ul JuBAS|3I 3] JoU Aew pue Aduejul s31 Ul os[e S| Sulsiaw jeay
21SB/ "SUOIIE||EISUL [BUUISY] JB[OS JO) BAIJUIIUISIP B 818840 10U p|noys
Ajuno) ay3 pue Aouejul ) Ul ||11S S1 SulIB1BW [BLLIBYY JB|0S :9jeuoney
*Mo[3q palou

se [TVIN¥IHL ¥v10S] £'€°€09 3siAsY NOLLVANIWWOIIY vaov
sappuedndo Y dnoun sydwsxs

ANV Juswadeldas walsAs |eaudse 3jajdwod e Supjeyspun ale
1ey3 spafoad pue uoi3onIIsuod mau o} uoniedijdde sy ‘9jdwexs 10y
‘Yarym [NOILYTOSI AvOT ANV SINIWHINDIY NDISIA NOILNGIYLSId
ADYINI] T°€09 01 Juawpudwe H( 1dopy :NOILVANIWINOIIY YOV
*$91puEdnI"0 Y dnoto sydwsxa gNY uawaoe|dal walsAs [ed143I)
219jdwod e Supjelsapun ale jey) spslold pue UOIINIISUOD MBU 0}
uopedijdde syuu| ‘sjdwexs 1o} ‘YaIYM [DNIHOLINOW ANV DNINILIN
ADY¥IN3] T°€09 03 Juswpuawe HA 1dopy :NOLLYANIWINODIY VEOY
[SNOISSING 220D 123HIANI ANV 193dia

IVANNVY] ‘z'zo9 Supep uoddns :NOLLVANIWWODIIY vdOov
*uo1I3s

siy} ul a8ensue| ay3 jo Auxa|dwod syl pue ‘soafoad Joy sisquinu 0D
a1 SululULIBISP JO BNjeA By} 1nNOge suollsanb aJe asey] :3jeuoney




IANON

-aJeda.d 03 swiy swos aynb pey aaey pue oBe siesA oml cTrmEmEou siy3 ur pa8edua sem AllSnpu) 218159 [B3) SYL 124D
9ye} 03 pasodoud st uondope 79[ 3Y3 18yl AShpul BU1 01 UOIIRIYIIOU JO SIBIA OM] Ised)| Je usaq sey asayL “AjSuipioe

uisap pue syafoud 10y Sutiedasd usym Junodde ojur $3PAI vm:m:u 3po2 3y el sjeuolssajold ugissp pue s1sdo[aasp ‘Jayuny

ﬁ *ssanoad

1eY1 3pnjouod o3 Ajunpoddo ajqeuoseas e Supyuwuad pue uBISap Olul ||9M SJe 1By} BS0UL SAIS 01 1eYM pue spaloud
pasodoud uo a9ejd UES UOMIPUOI SIY3 USPJING By} dzI[eal 9 “poriad aces8 Aep-08T e Suisodoud ale apn “AJojepuelt
Sal028q 2p0o3 Yl 310j2q poliad 30e.S Aep 09 e s] asaY} pa1dope aie SIPOI B JO LOISISA MaU e usym ‘AjeaidA) -e8usjieyd

aWes Sjyl S3}ea1d SPOI UOIIINIISUOI 3Y1 JO UOISIAA amw\sv: 3yt Jo uondope ay3 ul sHnsaJ YaIYm afueyd spAd 3pod yoeg

(odm)
Auedwo)
Auadouy
uo3duiysepy
Bunuasaidai
‘d11 48209
pue ssmoui]

01 pajedojal ulaq S| Yalym ‘92e|d $591804d JO UOI11eI0|
jua1In3) afoad || A9[diy 2y "SI o1 uonearjdde
uwiad Suippng e yuwigns o3 Suiiedsad Jo ssadoud ayl
ul sl DdM pue ‘(,pJeog Suluueld, ayl) pieog Bujuueld
Auno) AsawoSuoy syl woly sjeacidde ueld sus pue
‘ue|d Aeului|ald ‘ueld Yais paalsdad sey (Uopneao|
y24ny) |3yiag ayi Aaawiioy) 1afoud iseg Asjdiy

3y, ‘Buuds Jaa)s ut 1911351Q As[dry ay3 Ul $31IS OM)
Suidojaaap jo ssad01d ay3 ul AQusLIND s 3dM “pouad
uonisuel) 1o Supayiejpuess Aue utejuod AjjusLind

10U s90p uonen8ay pasodoid Y3 1843 S UIIU0D
Arewipd s Ddm ‘Burzeay aignd ay) 1e paAsauod am sy

(AL¥3AIYE HOL SLdYIDXT — SLNIWWOD 40 1517 ILITdNOD LON)
-Ajlenpes8 a1ow 133j4eW 3Y) uolyisuel) 01 3[2AI 3p0d

SIYl 10 dH G 1B pjoysalyl sy m:_ﬂwm Spuswwodal ygov .m>_uma._wu_m
ue se pasn aq ues siojow JAID3 INq ‘siojowl dH T JO} UOWIWOY j0U ate
SA4A ‘ojeuoliey .co_uawoxw |euoilippe ue pue pjoysatyl ._w\sonmw_o_._
J1ayBiy e dpnjpul 01 TOYLNOD NV (AVA) INNTOA HIV F18VINVA]
9'909 8siAaJ 03 88en3ue| DQ 3dopY :NOILVANIWWODIIY VEOV
“UO1199s PaIdIEp JA sadnpead

1599 [NOILVINSNI SNIdId JDVAH ANV SNILVIINIA ‘ONILYIH]
‘9’909 uopdss Bupepep Moddns :NOILVANIWINODIY VEOV
[ONI1S3L ONITYIS ANV NOLLYTNSNI WNNI1d

ANV 1Ond] €909 Uuoiods 2192 :NOILVANIWINOIIY vEOV
1211151 3Y3 Ui pa1wad Jou aie 3|qel 3yl Ul SdHSD JO SUOISIaA

23 Jo Auew se uoisiaoud siyl pals[Ep Os|e _IqUWN[0D JO 101ISId 3YL
‘alnjeu Aq Juaidiyd A1an Apeaiie aie Asyl se SN 1¥3IH 308N0S
ANNOYD Joy s3unes Aduspiyse 1s]f 03 PIau ou s| 318YL :ITYNOILVY
[SININFHINDIY FIINVINYOIYId ININDINDI

JVAH] "Z°909 uonaas 313130 :NOLLYANIWINODIY vaOov
(LNIINANIWY 2 130N ATIVILNISST) "MOoj3q palou se [SINILSAS
3d0T3IANT ONIQ1ING] 509 Uoi18s 1dopy :NOLLYANIININOGITY VIOV




INON

-aedaud 01 awiy awos sunb pey aAey pue ofe sieaA om] UO[1ESISAUCD SIY} Ul pa8eBua sem Alisnpul 81€1S3 [e3l S| "1984J3
aye1 03 pasodoud s uonidope 779} ay3 18y} Asnpul 313 01 UOIILJ11I0U JO SJedA 0M] 1SB3] 1B SR Sey a1ay] "AjSulpiodoe
uSisap pue spaloid 1oy Suiedasd uaym unoaze ojul s3[IAI 38uUBYD SPOd Aje} S|euo|ssajoid uSisep pue sisdojansp Jsyuny

*ssao0ud

1eY1 apN[U0d 03 Aunuoddo sjqeuoseas e Sunywiad pue udisap ojul [IBM 3Je Jey) S50Y1 SAIS 03 12UMm pue sysfoid
pasodoud uo 30e|d UED UOIHPUOI SIYY USPING Sy} 9zi[eal|ap “pouad ade.d Aep-0gT e Buisodoud aJe am aseH "Alolepuew

mmEoumn_mvoumEth_mnuo:mamoﬁm\»muomm m,_ Emﬁumuaovmemmmvoumcto:o_ﬂmfsw:m:m:\s.wm:m:m:u
awles SjU3 S918a40 S9POI UOIIINIISUOI BYL JO UOISIaA Hmm?m: ay1 jo uopdope ay3 ul s NsaL yd1ym adueyd sjaAo apod Yoe3
.wEmEE_:mvE wnuwiuiw 3y} aroge o8 03 siadojansp 38e4nodUs 03 SNURUOD

[l SAI3URIUI @Y1 PUE SIseq AIBIUN[OA B UO um:msa aq [|13S U UOAEJIIIBI I ‘DPO3 Se spepuels AJjgeuteisns

PUE UONEAISSUOD WINUIUIL 135 [[{M DIDI 3Y3 SIUM "D|qefjeA. 3q [[1S |im UO[1EoYIE) 13T YUM PI1RIIOSSE SBAIUIDUI XEL
“Buipjing 1uaKya ASI15Ua 3y} Jo uu:,mE._otwn_ panosdu] Y1 YUM 3L JOAO PRIAA0IRI 248 DD STOT
343 40 UO[IEIUBWSILI LM PSIRIIOSSE SIS0D U] UBAD ‘BI0UIBYLING "SJUSWSIINDSI 9P0d ABI3US M3U By 1931 0 paLIndul

SUISG MOU BJE JJD] U UM UOHIBULOD U] painsse Ajsnolaaud 1500 au1 0 150w D331 STOZ 43 40 Uoidope ay: Yim

3991 8y} 40 Ued a1e suawalinbal m:_hw“mE peaueyus ‘T°06 IVYHSY/3po) ABieu3 ayj ul uswainbal e
ApeaJje s1 doup a3e1|oA “uone|sidaj Doo| pasodoad syz jo SHuaWa)e J0u Be 8sBY) 05 uawdojaAap a1S J9A0 uodIPsUN] sey
pJeog SUIUUE|J 3Y) PUE J23BM WLI0LS JOAO UONDIPSUNI sey puejAIei 0 51835 8y L sjuawa.nbal uofieBllIN PUe(s| 1eaH pue

juswaBeuely s1sep 311S Ajuo suleal (wawdopaaq aus) ¥ 191deyd ©3D31 STOZ 3U3 Ul Apeal|e sl 003 DYAH pasueyua ‘3D

neid-198nod

ST0Z aY31 01 Ja4op sjuswaunbas BunysiAeq :aauesul 104 ‘pasodoud se 9pod sy3 03 Adde j0u op apew sjulod 9y Jo |e1aAaS P3N0 Juelig

‘UOIIDNLISUOD MAU JO 1502 3U3 01 %S Aja1ewixoidde
PPE |1 3waypds A1olejnat ul BIYS SIY1 18Y} PAPN[OU0D
sey sisAjeue Jeulalul umo Jne ‘quiod siyi o1 "Ajuno) ay}
1noy3nouy: spafosd UooNIISUOI MILU UO SABY pINod
uonejngay pasodoid ay1 1eyy 1edwi [epueuy [erusjod
3U31 J0 Buipue1SIBPUN J3113Q B X235 0} pue JIBgqpady
1121|0s 01 ANUNWWOI 31e1S3 |BDJ [BIDISWWIOD §,A1Uno)
3y} JO SJBqUISW YHM SBUl19DW DAIIURISNS JRUOIIPPE
POy 0} LIOYS Pa}JadU0d B 3Hew [uno) Ajuno)

3y3 pue (,5dd,,) S991AS Buimiwiad Jo juswnedaq
3y} ‘@140 5,2A1N08X3 AlUno) ayi ‘Sullde 810yaq ey}
ySe am pue ‘uoie|n8ay pasodold Siyl noge suIsaduod
SNOLI3s aABY am ‘Mojsq paure|dxa Se ‘ples 1ey}

YUM "291AJ3S pue ‘ues|d ‘@8euewl ‘1on11suod ‘do[aasp
am jeyy Auradoad Alsas ui sei8ajeais AjljiqeurRisns
Sunesodioou; pue Suidojaasp 01 pa1WIWod-Afny

s1 sajuedwo) Neld-198ino4 ‘sariunuiwod ssauisng
pue 21e1S3 |B8J (B20| BY] U] Japes| e sy ‘puefiepy
‘Aunon AsawoSiuolA ul paepuels udisap uipiing
3|qeuleisns pue UOJIBAIaSUOD ASIBUD 33 SB ZTOT DI
ay1 1dope o3 s1 uorie|nsay pasodoid aya Jo anB[GO
paiels ayi ‘aJeme ale noA sy *(,uone[nday pssodoid,
ay1) uotie|n8aJ sAINIAXa pasodoid paIusIRel
-9A0QE 33 YIM UOI1D3UU0D Ul NOA 03 Suljlim we |

-uonen8ay pasodold 3yl yum Ajdwod

03 JapJo ul sjeaozdde paeog Suiuueld 0} sjuSWIpuswe
Suninbas uans Ajqissod ‘pausisapal Ajpuesniusis

aq 03 pasu pjnom pafoid yoes ‘paloid Joyis

104 paniwgns aJe suoneddde ywiad Suip|ing 810j2q
‘payelp Ajjualind se ‘10340 saxel uonenday pasodold
3y1 J1 1y} st Suipuelstapun sJdMm ‘suwiad Suipjing oy
pa1nwgns 134 sey 10afoud Joyliau asnedaq ‘JsAamoH
"UOREIYISI Q337 104 |12UN0D BuIP|INg UBBID ‘SN

3UY1 ym paJaisidal uasq Apealje aaey s1rafoid yjog
‘uonppe Ul ‘pue sssooid udisap SuIMelp UoIONIISUOD
pajielsp sy ojul Apuestyiusis ale s39afoid Yyiog Ynsal
B SY "$HI9M M34 IX3U 3y} Uiym pleog uruueld ay3 03
jerosdde ue)d aus pue ueld Aleujwiaad Joy suonedljdde
sy Sumwigns aq [|IM DdM pue ‘pieog Sujuueld

2y1 woJj [erosdde ueld Yo1ads paniadal sey (d4y
penssi-A3uno) e o3 juensind diysisunied aieaud/ayqnd
e Jo Wed se yinos aiy} 0} Auadoud uopess aiid Yy




e uiq o3 3|qissod se s|j0o3 Auew se Su
19nJ3suod pue dojaasp 01 me| 3ul Ul Al
1UNOWE WNWIXew ay3 UaAd aq 1Snw siadojaasp s1e1se
[234 {e1JawwWwod ‘s393[o.d jnyssadons pling o1 Laplo

uy *(*2:@ pue aJowiijeg ||| suondipsinl Suipunolins
1930 Ul ay1jun) adueljdwod aAlleuIS}E pIemoy Yied e
yum siadojanap apiaoud jou saop uoiie|nday pasodold
s,Auno) ays ‘sjjiaydoy yo Aud aur Aq paxdope
spsepueas Suipling 2251 8Y3 1] ‘si JeyL JUsWdo[@AIp
|eJawwod Sujulesisucd 4o Joedw) papusiuiun

al1 aaey p(noad pue pidu 00} s| uone|nday pasodold
Y3 1Y) PaULISOUOD BB 3M ‘uoilIppe U] "uoliiladwod
Sujpuno.ins sy UeY} SUEUD] 3JLYJO 03 3jgernjiew

$53] Ajuno) AuswoSiuol jew pjnom ieyi Adljod

e ansind 03 asimun 31 Uiyl 9m ‘uoi3al 01BN DA Y1
1NoYSnoJy} spueuS) 10§ UONIIRdWOD 3Y] USAID “18)Jew
SIY} SuLI2IUS SJUBUD] [RI2IIUILLOD AQ (poo3sispun Ajisea
10) PSAIaJSI-|jaMm 9q 10U WBIW (piepue)s paseq-q3q] e
wolj Aeme sanow yoiym) uolieinday pasodoud ayi eyl
PauIaou0s 918 3M ‘(13348 |ED0] SY Ui PUBLUSP JUS1INI
3y pue) smej Suiisixa ayl 4o 31| u) "plepuels wnuield
J0 pjoD q331 e 9A3IYIE 18Y) sBUIP|Ing 93140 V' Ssej) Ul
aoeds Adnaoo 03 aJisap Azuna) Alawosiuo Ul 19xew
21L153 B3 3Y1 BulI9IUD MOU SJUBUS] [BIISWIWO0D
‘s}1Jouaq a|qe|ieae asayl ansiyde o) “(1aysiy

Jo) Suiiel pjoo @37 B 9A3IYDE 1BLY] SIUSWSLINbal
Kouaaiys Ja3em pue Asaua paseasou Suinbal

Aqg s1aafoad s|qeuleisns-Ajjeluswuoliaue 3ulp|ing

jo jeo8 s,Auno) ay3 uodn 3[ing sey 3ingsiayles

10 A1) ay3 ‘a|dwiexd jo Aem Ag *|aA3| palls)-q3 ] sH
pue 193[01d jo adAy ay3 uodn paseq swal Suiiea doy
pue sjunowe Sulhiea u] ypaLo xel Auadoud |eal e s18440
Auno) ay3 ‘s193fold palonsisuod-Almsu Ul spiepuels
AJI|IgRUIEISNS [BIUSWUOHAUS DZIAMUIIUL JSYN OL
wiajsAs Sunes g337 sieiidosdde sy Ui, [SAS] PLLILDD,
B 2A3]YJe 01 199} 81enbs gOQ‘OT UBYL J0W pue

$31101S ¥ URL3 JO}|EY BUip|INg SSN-Paxiwt 1o ‘Ajlwes-1jnw
‘(|lenuspisal-uou) paypow A[SAISUDIX ‘paIoNIISU0d
-Ajmau Aue saainbal Ajjuaina mej Ajuno) Alswoguop
‘MOUY NOA sy "3[qIsea} Ajjedlwouods 8q o3 ARl

ss9| ale Ajuno) AsawoB1uoly ul s199fo1d MsU Jeyy os i
yew pinos yaiym 3oedun Juesiusis e si siy1 ‘Aisnoinqo




-ue|d ays Jo uejd Ateuuaad

‘ue|d yo3a3s se Yans ‘paulelqo uaaq sey [eaosdde pieog
Sujuueld jo P9 Aue yarym Joj syafoud Aue Joj Jo
“Uwiad e Jog S4@ Jo JUSWS[RIIUS UE Joj pleog Sujuue(d
s5,A3uno) ay3 yum Apuaind pajy wonedijdde Aue

01 Yoene pjnoys uolje|nday pasodoid sy 1y uiyl
10U Op aMm “sea| AJan ayi 1y ‘uonensay pasodold sy
y3m Ajdwod o} padinbaJ jou pue Ul pasayiespuels, ag
p|noys ssado.d ay3 uf Suole ysnoua Jey si yoiym 3aafoid
e ‘pa3eal] 34 |jim ssao0id spuaLIBIRUS 3y} y3nodyt
Aem 4131 Supjew aJe 1ey3 s1a9{osd JU31IND MOY SSaIppe
1snw uopie[ngay pasodoid ay1 ‘sjdwexs o4 "plepuels
5| MaU Y3 OU] puB pJepuels g337 1Ua.1und ayl

wouy Alisnpul 91e159 |ead [0 841 ,UOIMSUEL], 03 pasu
3Y3 Japisuod [jim Aluno) 3y3 1eyl adoy am ‘spiepueis
Z10Z 2251 33 1dope 0} 39913 saop AlunoD syl i
‘Ajjeuld "saauanbasuod papusiuiun Y10 pue ‘Buisnoy
2|qepJloye ss9| ‘@nuanal xe] ss9| ‘sqol Joma) (puewap
panuijuo3 ay} 198w 03 *D°a PuUe BIUISIA UISYHION 33|
suopipsHn{ 8uipunouins 01 Suinow JUSWAOPASR MaU
yum) Auno) syl 1noysnoJyl 1UsWdOjaA3P [RIIISWWOD
ul 3sealaap e Suipn|pul ‘sAem SNOLIBA UI J|3S) 3s8jiuew
p|no pedwi siy ‘9s1nod JO ~Auno) ayi noysnoiyy
Juawdo[@Asp uo 193443 Bul[|IYo 319A3S € BAEL PIN0d
uole[nday pasodold Byl 1Byl pauULadU0I A|SNoLIsS

ale am ‘ynsal e sy "Ayjeuoiido ou yum yoeoadde
Jle-sny-azis-3u0, e 1dope pjnom uone|nsay pasodoid
s,A3uno) ay1 ‘gaaT MIuUN -ddueldwod Aypigeuieisns
[elU3WUOIIAUD 01 syled aieusalje Sulpiaoid

Aq Aujigixaly Jo 1os s1y1 yum siadojansp sapiaoad
wia1sAs ,[aA3] paibE),, @337 YL "uoiniy 01 103foid




